INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-001
Wise County, Texas
BID TITLE: Asphalt Road Surfacing Materials
SEALED BIDS WILL BE RECEIVED UNTIL: [0:00 a.m. central time, Thursday, August 4, 2016
RETURN BIDS TO:
Wise County Asset Control Office

400 W Walnut, Decatur, or
P.O. Box 952, Decatur, TX 76234

All bids must be submitted in a sealed envelope on the enclosed bid form and received on or before the time specified above. The bid
envelope must have a return address in the upper left hand corner and the bid name and number in the lower lefi hand corner.

SCOPE

Wise County is now accepting formal sealed bids for a contract for the purchase of Asphalt Road
Surfacing Materials for road construction applications.

This contract will be effective from October 1, 2016 through September 30, 2017.
This contract may be canceled with 30 days written notification by either party to the other.

SPECIFICATIONS

It is the intent of these specifications to describe Asphalt Road Surfacing Materials suitable for use on
county road construction.

Any catalog, brand name, or manufacturer’s reference used in describing an item is merely descriptive
and not restrictive unless otherwise noted, and is used only to indicate type and quality of material.
Bidders must state exactly what they intend to furnish. If bidder takes no exception to specifications or
reference data, he will be required to furnish items as specified in the bid.

Types and grades of HMAC materials, HMCL Type C & D, Warm Mix hereinafter mentioned must meet
specifications of the Texas Department of Transportation, 2004 Standard Specifications for Construction
of Highways, Streets and Bridges. For any that fall under Item 341 and special specification 3267 and
3268, no bonuses will be considered as part of this bid. Bidders unfamiliar with such specifications may
obtain copies of such specifications from the Texas Department of Transportation, District #2, Fort Worth
Office or TXDOT website http://www.dot.state.tx.us/business/englspec.htm.

Minimum temperature at delivery must be 275 degrees Fahrenheit for HMAC and 215 degrees
Farahrenheit for Warm Mix.
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Types and grades of Cold Mix Asphalt materials hereinafter mentioned must meet specifications of the
Texas Department of Transportation, 2004 Standard Specifications for Construction of Highways, Streets
and Bridges. For any that fall under Item 334, no bonuses will be considered as part of this bid. Bidders
unfamiliar with such specifications may obtain copies of such specifications from the Texas Department
of  Transportation, District #2, Fort Worth Office or TXDOT website
http:l/www.dot.state.bc.us/business/englspec.htm.

The County is seeking prices for materials loaded by the bidder's personnel and equipment and hauled by
Vendor or the County's personnel and equipment or by contracted means at the County’s discretion.

TYPES AND GRADES OF MATERIALS SOUGHT:

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement, Type D (HMACP})
- TX Dot, 2004 Standard Specifications for special specification 3267-3268

High Performance Asphalt Concrete
- TX Dot, Specifications, CMD-9200.002

Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete Pavement, Type B & C (HMACF)
- TX Det, 2004 Standard Specifications for special specification 3267-3268

Vendor must provide Hot-Mix designs prior to production of HMAC.
HMCL Type C& D
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B,C, & D
Cold Mix Asphalt

In order to comply with State laws concerning competitive bidding while maintaining as much continuity
as possible between the County and its contracted asphalt vendor(s), Wise County has elected to utilize a
*fluctuating price" contract(s) which takes the changing market conditions into consideration over the
contract period.

Pricing must remain firm for sixty (60) day increments. This specification provides for a price increase
every sixty (60) days, if needed, based upon price changes the bidder receives on liquid asphalt from the
supplier. All bidders desiring consideration of a price increase must supply documentation in the form of
current liquid asphalt invoice copies from bidder’s supplier, showing the average cost per ton for the
previous sixty (60) day period. This can result in a price increase or price reduction, depending on the
current liquid asphalt price. All other factors that affect the price should be incorporated into the bid
price. This price must be approved by Commissioners’ Court before it will be effective.

It is extremely important that bidders note that the geographical location of the various bidders' plants
where materials may be obtained will bear heavily in the Court's consideration of bids. Thus, it is
essential that each bidder's bid fully and accurately detail the locations of such bidder's facilities from
which the materials are to come.
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ESTIMATED QUANTITIES

Because Wise County's needs are seasonal in nature, it is not feasible to offer prospective bidders
estimated quantities needed during the year. Wise County will in no way be bound to purchase any
predetermined amounts under this contract. All purchases will be based on the county’s actual needs.

GENERAL CONTRACT TERMS AND CONDITIONS

The contract price for this service must include all ancillary costs associated with the service.
The bidder reserves the right to charge any price desired as long as it does not exceed the bid price.

All invoices will be paid on a net 30 basis. No late fees or interest charges are to be assessed against the
county.

Inveices must show the address and department where the service was
required and the bid number. Each department/precinct must be invoiced
separately.

Invoices must be sent to:

Wise County Auditor's Office
P.O. Box 899

Decatur, TX 76234
940-627-5744

Funds for payment on this contract have been provided through the Wise County budget approved by
Commissioners’ Court for this fiscal year only. State of Texas statutes prohibit the obligations and
expenditure of public funds beyond the fiscal year for which a budget has been approved. Therefore,
anticipated orders or other obligations that may arise past the end of the current Wise County fiscal year
shall be subject to budget approval. The fiscal year for the County extends from October 1¥ of each
calendar year to September 30" of the next calendar year.

The bidder must provide pricing (unit or lump sum) as requested on the bid form. Prices quoted shall
remain firm for the period of the contract and shall include the cost of installation if required in the
specifications, shipping, and delivery of item to the designated point unless pickup is required and stated
in the bid and shall not include Federal or State of Texas sales, excise and use taxes.

The undersigned affirms they have familiarized themselves with the local conditions under which the
work is to be performed and have satisfied themselves of matters that may be incidental to the work
before submitting a bid.

Bidders must submit their bids on the attached forms and they must be originally signed.
Bids not submitted on these forms will be summarily disqualified. NO 3 RING BINBERS

Faxed or emailed bids will not be accepted.

M
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By submitting and signing the attached bid forms, each bidder is indicating that he has read and
understood the instructions, terms, conditions, specifications, and invitation to bid and agrees to comply
with and be bound by its precepts. Submission of a bid form shall constitute an offer on such terms that
shall remain open and irrevocable until such time as a bid submitted on same has been accepted by the
Commissioners’ Court of Wise County, Texas. Acceptance of same by the Court shall create a contract
between the parties based upon the instructions, terms, conditions, specifications, invitation to bid, and the
bid forms. Award notice will include information on form 1295 disclosure that must be completed
and returned prior to any bid award being considered final, contract being signed by Wise County,
any Purchase Order being issued by Wise County, or any notice to proceed with work being issued
by Wise County. Wise County cannot advise on the form 1295. As this is 2 new law and form, if
you have questions, the Texas Ethics Commission implemented the law and generated the form so
we would suggest calling them at 512-463-5800 or https://www.ethics.state.tx.us.

Continuing non-performance of the vendor in terms of specifications shall be basis for termination of the
contract by Wise County. Wise County shall not pay for work, equipment, or supplies that are
unsatisfactory. Vendors will be given a reasonable opportunity before termination to correct the
deficiencies. However, this shall in no way be construed as negating the basis for non-performance
termination.

A Conflict of Interest Questionnaire and explanation has been included with this bid packet. If you have
any questions about compliance, please consult your own legal counsel. Compliance is the individual
responsibility of each individual, business, or agent who is subject to the laws filing requirements. If you
are required to file a Conflict of Interest Questionnaire, the original signed questionnaire should be filed
with the County Clerk’s Office. DO NOT INCLUDE THIS FORM WITH THE BID PACKET. IT
WILL NOT BE FILED BY ASSET CONTROL.

Wise County Clerk
P.O. Box 359
200 N Trinity
Decatur, TX 76234
940-627-3351

The bid analysis will inciude compliance to bid specifications, past performance with vendor, warranty,
delivery time, and the overall cost 10 Wise County. Wise County reserves the right to consider deviations
from these specifications. All bids meeting the intent of this invitation to bid will be considered for
award. Bidders taking exception to the specifications, or offering substitutions, shall state these
exceptions in the section provided or by attachment as part of the bid. The absence of such a list shall
:ndicate that the bidder has not taken exceptions and shall hold the bidder responsible to perform in strict
accordance with the specifications of the invitation. Wise County Commissioners’ Court reserves the
right to accept any and all or none of the exception(s)/substitution(s) deemed to be in the best interest of
the County.

Award, if any, will be made to the responsible bidder(s) submitting the lowest and/or best bid price(s) for
the item(s) as specified and meeting all the requirements of the invitation to bid. All information required
by the bid form must be furnished. To be determined will not be considered an answer. It should be
understood by all bidders that Wise County reserves the right to reject bid submissions that do not meet
the requirements of the invitation to bid and that do not contain all of the documentation detailed below.

1. Bid form completed in its entirety and originally signed
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2. Price Sheets
3. Affidavit

Wise County reserves the right to accept and/or reject any and all bids or proposals for any reason
whatsoever.

Wise County reserves the right to waive any minor technicalities.

ADDITIONAL NOTICE TO BIDDERS

BY RESOLUTION PASSED ON FEBRUARY 23, 2004, THE WISE COUNTY COMMISSIONERS’
COURT RESERVES THE RIGHT TO REFUSE TO CONSIDER ANY BID SUBMITTED BY ANY
PERSON OR ENTITY THAT IS CURRENTLY INDEBTED TO WISE COUNTY.

APPLICABLE DATES AND TIMES

The bids will be reccived in the Wise County Asset Control Office at 400 W Walnut in Decatur, Texas,
untit 10:00 a.m. central time, Thursday, August 4, 2016.

The Wise County Asset Control Office will date and time receive stamp all bids upon their receipt.
The County assumes no responsibility for the timely delivery of any bid by anyone or any entity.

Those bids that come in after the above mentioned time will be summarily disqualified and will be left
unopened uniess it is necessary to open the bid envelope to return a bid bond or check.

No modifications may be made to bids after the time set for the bid opening. Bids may be withdrawn up
to, but not after, the time set for bid opening,.

The bids will be opened and publicly read in the County Asset Control Office at 10:00 a.m. central time,
Thursday, August 4, 2016.

Bids will be considered for award in Wise County Commissioners’ Court at the next regularly scheduled
Commissioners’ Court at the location posted on the agenda. All bidders are encouraged to be present at
the bid opening and the bid awarding to defend and answer questions about their bid.

If due to inclement weather or any reason beyond our control the Asset Control Office is closed on the
scheduled bid opening date or time, the bid opening date and time will be the same time on the first day
the office is reopened for business. Should this be after the original Commissioners’ Court date set for
award, the award will be considered in the next scheduled Commissioners” Court after the opening.

Any explanation desired by a bidder regarding the meaning or interpretation of the invitation for bids,
drawings, specifications, etc., must be requested in writing and with sufficient time allowed for a reply
to reach bidders before the submission of their bids. Any interpretation made will be in the form of an
addendum of the invitation for bids, drawings, specifications, etc., and will be furnished to all
prospective bidders. Receipt of all addenda must be acknowledged by the bidder by signing and
returning the addenda with the bid. All addenda will be bound with and made a part of the contract
documents. Oral explanations or instructions given before the award of the contract will not be binding.
Written requests shall be emailed to: Diana Alexander at Diana.alexander{@co.wise.tx.us.
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TITLE

The bid must be submitted in a sealed envelope with the following written on the outside lower left-hand
corner of the envelope

"ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS, BID NO. 17-600-001"

The bid envelope must also have the bidder's complete return address in the upper left-hand corner of the
outside of the envelope.
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
BID NO. 17-600-001

e

Bidder's Name: APAC) - {fgag Anc .
Address: WZIOME Kt A 2| I"V‘“,’i Alud

Mailing Address: Po BovzzrtoUy

CityStae/Zip: __ Dallas T 15222 Hodg

Phone Number: (34 74]-3573 ) Fax Number: (29 242 — 3SYQ

Email: SV‘MCc_o-wa_Jc\/u’/@ a—g)afc L CO

Person to Contact: g‘} eJveé A”\ ¢ CO V\(:C{’L'\y

MUST INCLUDE ATTACHED PRICE FORMS

Purchase Price must include any and all charges. Any extraneous fees or charges that will or may
be invoiced to the County must be disclosed on this form. This includes, but is not limited to
freight, fuel or travel surcharges, overtime rate, etc.

Should other Governmental Entities located within Wise County decide to participate in this contract, would you, the Vendor,
agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply?

v’ Yes No

If you, the Bidder, checked yes, the following will apply:
“Governmental Entity’s located within Wise County utilizing Inter-Governmental Contracts with Wise County will be
eligible, but not obligated, to purchase materials/services under the contract(s) awarded as a result of this solicitation. All
purchases by Governmental Entity’s other than Wise County will be billed directly to that Governmental Entity and paid
by that Governmental Entity. Wise County will not be responsible for another Governmental Entity’s debts. Each
Governmental Entity will order their own material/services as needed. The Vendor agrees that all terms, conditions,
specifications, and pricing would apply.”

Signature: ﬁﬁ/ﬂ ({%

Typed Name and Title: Steve .ﬂ//(‘(; ,M,',LL/V 5;. ({’6 Wlacoqey
7
Date: 9/‘1' -~ et
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Precinct (if not for all copy and circle precinctf#) 12 3 4

Hot Mix Asphalt, Type D

s ‘11 = per ton FOB plant
§  S€E Mo dendor delivered
High-Performance Asphalt Concrete

Netv= -

- ¢ L i
$ 95.%° per ton FOB plant ,* P\AUL \J[L/*TE ds i - 5 /Vn/?S R ¢ Pev 40:4’@&::[-7.&

$35E€Z ATE vendor delivered Ckc;‘é 3o d Per -1Lc W fer cach a dcl chonral //e’,
Hot Mix Asphalt, Type B

§ L% perton FOB plant

§ $EF MVTE vendor delivered

Hot Mix Asphalt, Type C

$_Yi (?_Q pet ton FOB plant

$ € NTE_ vendor delivered

HMCL, Type C

$ e Bio per ton FOB plant
s M 310 vendor delivered
HMCL, Type D

s 15, X _per ton FOB plant
§ SE& Mot vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type B

$ '—{(a.o—? per ton FOB plant
$<e& NeTE  vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type C

s, g.q:: per ton FOB plant
§ 4 €2 NeTE vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type D

s Y E! .Dﬁ per ton FOB plant

$ SEE NCTE  vendor delivered
Cold Mix Asphalt

L&)
s_ 15 o< per ton FOB plant

lent_4(¢ Cﬁ/%‘ir Chuco W76 y3/

$ €% #°VE vendor delivered P

Plant Location: Lﬁtﬂﬂ"" f‘h\Cc
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Bid: Asphalt Road Surfacing Materials, 17-600-001
STATE OF TEXAS (

COUNTY OF WISE (
AFFIDAVIT

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, a Notary Public in and for the State of Texas, on this

day personally appeared C o Bobbora known to me
to be the person whose name is subscribed to the following, who, after having first duly swomn, upon oath,
did depose and say:

That the foregoing bid submitted by A\ VAC Tevas (o
hereinafter called “Bidder” is the duly authorized agent of said company and that the person signing said
bid has been duly authorized to execute the same. Bidder affirms that they are duly authorized to execute
this contract, that this company, corporation, firm, partnership or individual has not prepared this bid in
collusion with any other Bidder. The contents of this bid as to prices, terms or conditions of said bid have
not been communicated by the undersigned nor by any empioyee or agent to any other person engaged in
this type of business prior to the official opening of this bid.

I am the affiant in the above-mentioned bid. I have personal knowledge of the facts contained in
the foregoing statement and they are true and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.
Name and Address of Bidder:

Bidder: APAC - Teyao Lo

/
signed by: X C oo Dobbora (“;W
/ ras——

L>=eg

Address: ?O P)OK 27U 0481 D llele, T 9¢2 20 - Yo ¢s

Telephone: 2.4 -7 [-3<73) Date: & “| - 2006

4 [HE ~ IExae . ny
Affiant

Name: G u\\(/ ?JZJ’) é)«: Vo
Title: _ feco Lk W\WQ%\GV
SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED BEFORE ME THIS _~\day of 1) 3\0\4 20 1.
—~reey P

oy

@
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CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES

APAC-TEXAS, INC.

€ AFFIDAVIT

ForM 1295
Tofl
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and § if there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 If there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity‘s place Certificate Number:
of business. 2016-103165
APAC-TEXAS, INC.
Dallas, TX United States Date Filed:
Name of govemmental enilty or state agency that is a party (o the contract for which the form is 08/23/2016
being filed.
Wise County Asset Control Office Date Acknowledged:
[ y
£-29-1

Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identily the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

Bid No. 17-600-001
Purchase of Asphalt Road Surfacing Materials

Nature of interest
Name of interested Party Clty, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)

Controlling { Intermediary
X

Dallas, TX United States

5 Check only i there is NO Interested Party.

O

| swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

i, PATRICIA L MoUALL
@ NOTARY PUBLIC d‘
"\ »;  Siste of Texas
i‘w& Comm. Exp. 11-13-2018

s&gnatmeofmnm agent of contracting business entity
Steve McConathy, Sales Manager
AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Sworn 1o and subscribed before me, by the said _Stev tisthe_23rd dayol_August
2016 , t0 certify which, witness my hand and seal of office.

Admin. Asst. and

ary _Public

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission Version v1.0.277



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
BID NO. 17-600-001

Bidder's Name: Reynolds Asphalt & Construction Compamy

Address: 8713 Airport Freeway Suite 100 North Richland Hills Texas 76180

Mailing Address: __P.0. Box 370

City/State/Zip: Fuless, Texas 76039

Phone Number: ( ) 817-267-3131 _ Fax Number: () _817-267-18/8

Email: beuykendall@reynoldsasphalt.com

Person to Contact:  Bob Cuykendall

MUST INCLUDE ATTACHED PRICE FORMS

Purchase Price must include any and all charges. Any extraneous fees or charges that will or may
be invoiced to the County must be disclosed on this form. This includes, but is not limited to
freight, fuel or travel surcharges, overtime rate, ete,

Should other Governmental Entities located within Wise County decide to participate in this contract, would you, the Vendor,
agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply?

X Yes No

If you, the Bidder, checked yes, the following will apply:
“Governmental Entity’s located within Wise County utilizing Inter-Governmental Contracts with Wise County will be
eligible, but not obligated, to purchase materials/services under the contract(s) awarded as a result of this solicitation. All
purchases by Governmental Entity's other than Wise County will be billed directly to that Governmental Entity and paid
by that Governmental Entity. Wise County will not be responsible for another Governmental Entity’s debts. Each
Governmental Entity will order their own material/services as nceded. The Vendor agrees that all terms, conditions,
specifications, and pricing would apply.”

Signature: }7::9' d‘uveu/z

Typed Name and Title: Ned Tankersley Vice President

Date: ) August 2 2016
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»Prec'in.ct (if not for all copy and circle precinct#) 1 2 3 4

Hot Mix Asphalt, Type D

$ 52,00  perton FOB plant
5 E)il .98 vendor delivered
High-Performance Asphalt Concrete
sl@ Bid per ton FOB plant
$ vendor delivered
Hot Mix Asphalt, Type B

b3 50.00 per ton FOB plant
$ 59,98  vendordelivered
Hot Mix Asphalt, Type C

3 52.00 per ton FOB plant

$ 61.98 vendor delivered

HMCL, Type C

s No Bid per ton FOB plant

S o _vendor delivered
HMCL, Type D
$ "™ - No Bid >~ __perton FOB plant

$ vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type B

s 51.00 per ton FOB plant
s_60. 98 vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type C
$_53.00 per ten FOB plant
$ 62.98 vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type D

$__53 - 0077 per ton FOB plant

$ £2.98 vendor delivered

Cold Mix Asphalt

$ No Bid per ton FOB plant

$ ~ vendor delivered

Plant Location: _ 10015 Hicks Field Road Sasinaw, Texas———
‘Haul Rates are based on 22 tonrmrmn.musn’g flowboys if available
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E

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES corm 1295
lotl

Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 it there are interested parties. OFFICE USE ONLY

Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are no interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING

1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place
of business.
Reynolds Asphalt & Construction Company
North Richland Hills, TX United States

Certificate Number:
2016-113670

Date Filed:

2 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the torm is
being filed.

Wise County

09/19/2016

Date Acknowledged:

A -A0-1k

description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.

3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a

17-600-001
Hot Mix Asphalt Concrete
4 Nature of interest
Name of Interested Party City, State, Country (place of business) (check applicable)
Controlling | Intermediary
5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party. .

6 AFFIDAVIT

i,

SR bt LAURA BETH MAYO
St Gary Public, State Of fexas
X ,( My Comenission Expies
ZAR June 17, 2019

o)

1 swear, or affirm, under penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

L on Lo L

Srtes 1oy
1yt 8 S
iyt

e 7t

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

Neld Tt"u-ker&]&"r

Signature of authorized agent of contracting business entity

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the said
20 t L , to certify which, witness my hand and saal of office.

[_ﬁu(/m/)’la,qo

, this the /ﬁ“" dayof‘%al'ﬁnéé&.

G)n/’W /%(Hn,

SiGpdiurd of officer administering oaih Printed name of officer adminis)(ering aath

Title of officer administering oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission www,ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
BID NO. 17-600-001

Bidder's Name:  Austin Asphalt, LP

Address: 6330 Commerce Drive, Suite 150, Irving, Texas 75063

Mailing Address: _ n/a

City/State/Zip: n/a

Phone Number: ( ) __817-926-0415 Fax Number: ( ) 214-596-7397

Email: ptinsley@austin-ind.com

Persan to Contact: _ Pat Tinsley

MUST INCLUDE ATTACHED PRICE FORMS

Purchase Price must include any and all charges. Any extraneous fees or charges that will or may
be invoiced to the County must be disclosed on this form. This includes, but is not limited to

freight, fuel or travel surcharges, overtime rate, etc.

Should other Governmental Entities located within Wise County decide to participate in this contract, would you, the Vendor,
agree that all terms, conditions, specifications, and pricing would apply?

X yes No

If you, the Bidder, checked yes, the following will apply:
“Governmental Entity’s located within Wise County utilizing Inter-Governmental Contracts with Wise County will be

eligible, but not obligated, to purchase materials/services under the contract(s) awarded as a result of this solicitation. All
purchases by Governmental Entity’s other than Wise County will be billed directly to that Governmental Entity and paid
by that Governmental Entity. Wise County will not be responsible for another Governmental Entity’s debts. Each
Governmental Entity will order their own material/services as needed. The Vendor agrees that all terms, conditions,

specifications, and pricing would apply.”

AN S
e
Signature: l/ W ¢ \E\ ,,V\!,\J\r\\

Typed Name and Title: _Eric JohnsoR, General Plants Manager

Date:  August 4, 2016
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Precinct (if not for all copy and circle precinct#) 12 3 4

Hot Mix Asphalt, Type D

53995  perton FOB plant Note: Haul rate 1 to 5 miles from plant site at $4.50 per ton, add $0.32
$ see note®  vendor delivered per ton for each additional mile after 5.

High-Performance Asphalt Concrete

s_nobid  perton FOB plant Note: Austin Asphalt is in the process of building a new asphalt
¢ no bid vendor delivered plant that will be used to produce materials for this bid.
At this point and time, projected completion of this plant
is scheduled for November 1, 2016. This date could be
§.35.50 per ton FOB plant affected by weather and other circumstances out of our
control. Austin Asphalt will notify the Commissioners of
progress as we proceed. In the interim, Austin Asphalt
Hot Mix Asphalt, Type C will offer hot mix from our Fort Worth location delivered

§ 38.50 per ton FOB plant to your project site at the delivered rate from our new
Bridgeport location.

Hot Mix Asphalt, Type B

§_see note® vendor delivered

§ See note™  yendor delivered

HMCL, Type C

s 65.00 per ton FOB plant
5 See note”  yendor delivered
HMCL, Type D

§_65.00 per ton FOB plant
§_seenote™ vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type B

§_ 3550 per ton FOB plant
s_See note” yendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type C

¢ 38.50 per ton FOB plant
§_Se€ note” vendor delivered
Warm Mix Asphalt, Type D
§_39.95 per ton FOB plant
§_see note®  vendor delivered
Cold Mix Asphall

s_65.00 per ton FOB plant

W
§ See note vendor delivered

1795 South Highway 101, Bridgeport, Texas 76426

Plant Location:

MM.
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Bid: Asphalt Road Surfacing Materials, 17-600-001
STATE OF TEXAS (

COUNTY OF WISE {
AFFIDAVIT
BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority, a Notary Public in and for the State of Texas, on this

Eric Johnson known to me

day personally appeared

to be the person whose name is subscribed to the following, who, after having first duly sworn, upon oath,
did depose and say:

That the foregoing bid submitted by __Austin Asphalt, LP
hereinafter called “Bidder” is the duly authorized agent of said company and that the person signing said
bid has been duly authorized to execute the same. Bidder affirms that they are duly authorized to execute
this contract, that this company, corporation, firm, partnership or individual has not prepared this bid in
collusion with any other Bidder. The contents of this bid as to prices, terms or conditions of said bid have
not been communicated by the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to any other person engaged in
this type of business prior to the official opening of this bid. '

[ am the affiant in the above-mentioned bid. I have personal knowledge of the facts contained in
the foregoing statement and they are true and correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

FURTHER AFFIANT SAYETH NAUGHT.

Name and Address of Bidder:

Bidder: Austin Asphalt, LP

Signed by: Eric Johnson

Address: 6330 Commerce Drive, Suite 150, Irving, Texas 750863
Telephone: (817) 925-0415 Date: August4, 2016

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED
$ S, | AURIE S. STOVA

Ut

Bid # 17-600-001

oy L

X Notary Public, State of Texes
0% Comm. Expires 12/02/2018
X8 Notary ID 5160078

Pl CFgFOF X

Asphaltoad Surfacing Materials

Austin AsphaJt7LP

Affiant / )
[ T
b Mh\_‘ w‘\*“”“m‘\\

Eric Johnson
Title:  General Plants\Manager
3
RE METHIS _*" /@y of _ August .20 18

i‘"mbubué_’ (X M’Uw@/

Notary Public in and for the State of Texas

Name:

iL

' e e e i i
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Name of Interested Party

CERTIFICATE OF INTERESTED PARTIES
FORM 1295
lof1l
Complete Nos. 1 - 4 and 6 if there are interested pauties, OFFICE USE ONLY
Complete Nos. 1, 2, 3, 5, and 6 if there are na interested parties. CERTIFICATION OF FILING
1 Name of business entity filing form, and the city, state and country of the business entity's place Certificate Number:
of business. 2016-99797
Austin Asphalt, LP
Irving, TX United States Date Filed:
7 Name of governmental entity or state agency that is a party to the contract for which the form is 08/16/2016
being filed.
Wise County Date Acknowledged:
3 Provide the identification number used by the governmental entity or state agency to track or identify the contract, and provide a
description of the services, goods, or other property to be provided under the contract.
Bid No. 17-600-001
Purchase of Asphalt Road Surfacing Materials, October 1, 2016 to September 30, 2017
s Nature of interest

City, State, Country (place of business)

{check applicable)
Controlling Intermediary

5 Check only if there is NO Interested Party.

6 AFFIDAVIT

P
‘AAAAAAAAL‘A‘
-~

a .ulm;,,”’ . STOVALL
b U"cg, 'ﬁﬁg‘,ﬂg&a&, State of Texas

& Comm. Explres 12/
o Notery 10 5160078

AFFIX NOTARY STAMP / SEAL ABOVE

02/2018

oYy

| swear, or affirm, undes penalty of perjury, that the above disclosure is true and correct.

Signature of autKdrized agent of contracting business entity

Sworn to and subscribed before me, by the sald Eric Schranz thisthe __16th day of August
20 16, to certily which, witness my hand and seal of office.
o, P - ) o/
TR S Tl .
(- A Laurie S. Stovall Notary Public

Signature of officer administering oath

Printed name of officer administering oath

Title of officer administeting oath

Forms provided by Texas Ethics Commission

www.ethics.state.tx.us

Version V1.0.277




