WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-029
HEATING/AIR CONDITIONING SERVICE/REPAIR CONTRACT

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, July 7, 2016

Mann Refrigeration TD Industries
Bridgeport, TX Fort Worth, TX
06/28/16 9:39am 07/06/16 10:40am

Regular Hourly Rate $60.00 $86.00
Overtime/After Hour/Weekend/Holiday Rate $90.00 $126.00
Discount % off parts 10% 15%
Service Charge $0.00 $185.00
Notes
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-030
VARIOUS METAL-FENCE REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, July 7, 2016

CF Metals Whitaker Metal The Railroad Yard
Fort Worth, TX Waxahachie, TX Stillwater, OK
6/24/2016 9:58am  7/7/2016 9:31am  6/30/2016 8:54am
Price for 400' of 3 4/2 " ID pipe $1,764.00 $2,040.00 no bid
Price for 200' of 2" pipe $416.00 $324.00 no bid
Price for 400' of 3/4" rod $359.00 $180.00 no bid
Total $2,539.00 $2,544.00 NO BID

CF Metal 2" pipe is ID, no affidavit inciuded so not compliant with bid requirements

Whitaker 2" pipe is OD, bid alternate on 3 1/2" OD pipe for $1200.00, Whitaker total with 3 1/2" OD pipe $1,704.00
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-030
VARIOUS METAL-FENCE REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, July 7, 2016
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STEEL FIOOR & ROOF DECK SLTPLIER
Metal Buildings & Components
Pipe Fencing Accessories

We Stock Cut-to-Length and
Deliver Must Tupes of Floor & Roof Deck

Michael W. Bradshaw

President
Email: mbradshawi@whitakermetabdeck sales com

PO. Box 551 ROO F M. R79 Phone: {972) 938-1445
Waxahachie. Texas 75168 Fax: (972) 938-1314




Amanda Knox
m

From: Diana Alexander <diana.alexander@co.wise.tx.us>
Sent: Monday, July 11, 2016 11:38 AM

To: Amanda Knox

Subject: corrected bid tab

Attachments: 16-612-030 VARIOUS METAL-FENCE REPAIR.xIs
Amanda,

Bid tabs attached are corrected in the bid number...changed from 600 to 612.

Thanks,
Diana




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-612-030
VARIOUS METAL-FENCE REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, July 7, 2016

CF Metals Whitaker Metal The Railroad Yard
Fort Worth, TX Waxahachie, TX Stillwater, OK
6/24/2016 9:58am  7/7/2016 9:31am  6/30/2016 8:54am
Price for 400" of 3 1/2 " ID pipe $1,764.00 $2,040.00 no bid
Price for 200' of 2" pipe $416.00 $324.00 no bid
Price for 400" of 3/4" rod $359.00 $180.00 no bid
Total $2,539.00 $2,544.00 NO BID

CF Metal 2" pipe is ID, no affidavit included so not compliant with bid requirements
Whitaker 2" pipe is OD, bid alternate on 3 1/2" OD pipe for $1200.00, Whitaker total with 3 1/2" OD pipe $1,704.00




