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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 16-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 6, 2015

Lane Construction Lane Construction
VENDOR Roanoke, TX Roanoke, TX
8/6/15 9:56am 8/6/115 9:56am
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
High Performance Asphailt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Hot mix asphalt, type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid no bid
PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphait, type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Hot mix asphalt, type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphait Type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid no bid
PRECINCT #3
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Hot mix asphalt, type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid no bid
PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphatt, type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Hot mix asphalt, type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $53.75 no bid $50.00 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 no bid $50.25 *see below note
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $57.75 no bid $54.25 *see below note
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid no bid
PLANT LOCATION Justin Chico

* Lane delivered Haul Rate 1-5 miles $4.00 per ton and .30¢ per ton for each additional mile




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 16-600-001
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

Reynolds Asphait APAC
VENDOR Euless, TX Dallas, TX
8/5/15 2:25pm 8/4/15 10:21am
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphait, type D $52.70 $62.68 $48.00 * see note below
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid $95.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type B $49.00 $58.98 $44.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type C $52.70 $62.68 $46.00 * see note below
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $50.10 $60.08 $50.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see note below
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.70 $62.68 $48.00 * see note below
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid $95.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type B $49.00 $58.98 $44.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type C $52.70 $62.68 $46.00 * see note below
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $50.10 $60.08 $50.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see note below
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
PRECINCT #3
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.70 $62.68 $48.00 * see note below
High Performance Asphait
Concrete no bid no bid $95.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type B $49.00 $58.98 $44.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type C $52.70 $62.68 $46.00 * see note below
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $50.10 $60.08 $50.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see note below
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.70 $62.68 $48.00 * see note below
High Performance Asphalit
Concrete no bid no bid $95.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type B $49.00 $58.98 $44.00 * see note below
Hot mix asphalt, type C $52.70 $62.68 $46.00 * see note below
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $50.10 $60.08 $50.00 * see note below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 * see nole below
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $54.00 $63.98 $52.00 . * see note below
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $75.00 * see note below
PLANT LOCATION Saginaw Chico

Reynolds Asphalt-Warm Mix depends on plant availability. Haul Rates are based on 22 ton minimum using flowboys if available.
APAC-Haul Rate 1-5 miles $5.00 per ton additional .30c per ton for each additional mile



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 16-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

Austin Asphait
VENDOR Irving, TX

8/5/15 2:51pm
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.25 $59.47
High Performance Asphait
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $47.25 $54.47
Hot mix asphait, type C $50.00 $57.22
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 $72.22
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $48.50 $55.72
Warm Mix Asphait Type C $51.00 $58.72
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $53.50 $60.72
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.25 $58.52
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $47.25 $53.52
Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $56.27
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 $71.27
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $48.50 $54.77
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $51.00 $57.27
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $53.50 $59.77
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PRECINCT #3
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.25 $60.98
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $47.25 $55.98
Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $58.73
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 $73.73
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $48.50 $57.23
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $51.00 $59.73
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $53.50 $62.23
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $52.25 $58.26
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $47.25 $53.26
Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $56.01
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 $71.01
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $48.50 $54.51
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $51.00 $57.01
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $53.50 $59.50
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PLANT LOCATION Bridgeport

Austin Asphalt-requires a minimum production of 250 tons per day or $1000 plant start up fee will be charged.




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 16-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 6, 2015

VENDOR

(P

PRECINCT #1

DELIVERED

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED w—m

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalit, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

(“3Y /35N

Hot mix asphait, type B

(]

Hot mix asphalit, type C

N —
————

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphait Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

’)
%

...t“;ﬁ

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

-

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #3

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Q,’p@ o :%'WVO |

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #4

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Wam Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PLANT LOCATION




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 16-600-001
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

VENDOR

Crq A
(Reo, nold m?b\w

PRECINCT #1

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

DELIVERED —1

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalt, type D

2 10

02 9P

5
9

High Performance Asphait
Concrete

I

H

v’«i
[
e‘w‘

Hot mix asphalit, type B

49 5%

A |

¥

Hot mix asphalt, type C

5.0

X

-An

P

-
g

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

'154‘:
o B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

é;Ilu

by
5

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphait Type D

SR

30
e

Cold Mix Asphalt

Ik

J
L1

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphait
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphait Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #3

Hot mix asphait, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphait Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

0 67| 1) [l

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #4

Hot mix asphalt, type D

e 2R RREINVARE ER T
s | () % o

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphait, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PLANT LOCATION

1\‘/\
Cliico
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 16-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

Nt (ophalk

VENDOR
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphalt, type D S AS -4
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete ) —
Hot mix asphait, type B A1 AN SY.Y7
Hot mix asphatt, type C D 6o S7.27.
HMCL Type C — p—
HMCL Type D o, P
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B ) SS. 72
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C .80 SK. 1722
Warm Mix Asphait Type D 53D .72
Cold Mix Asphalt — —
PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D 2.5 <K S
High Performance Asphalt o
Concrete
Hot mix asphalt, type B ). 2SS NED=Y
Hot mix asphalt, type C 0.0 S .23
HMCL Type C — —_
HMCL Type D L. 00 NU2T
Warm Mix Asphait Type B J¥. <o Y1)
~ |warm Mix Asphalt Type C <) A 7.7
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D ~3 .30 <G 7
Cold Mix Asphalt —— —
PRECINCT #3.
Hot mix asphait, type D T 2A< nHh K4
High Performance Asphalt M
Concrete J— —
Hot mix asphat, type B V13 BONN 59K
Hot mix asphalt, type C <) .0x) <K, 12
HMCL Type C — St
HMCL Type D S 0D 13,72
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B 2LE. <0 S72.25
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C 500D =5 .22
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D <. <0 23
Cold Mix Asphalt — —
PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphatt, type D Lol TR 24
High Performance Asphalt —
Concrete . —
Hot mix asphalt, type B AT &S 3.4
Hot mix asphalt, type C <0, D SGD |
HMCL Type C — o
HMCL Type D [/5. O 1. 9]
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B AX SO <d .51
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C <, 80 <71.01
Warm Mix Asphait Type D 2.8 <q . D
Cold Mix Asphalt o~ Ja—
PLANT LOCATION e (LAY =
-
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-009
PEST CONTROL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 6, 2015

All-Rid Pest Mid Cities Pest Wise Chem
Decatur, TX Hurst, TX Decatur, TX
8/6/2015 8:09am 8/6/2015 9:51am 8/6/2015 9:12am
Reg Add Reg Add Reg Add

SO/JAIL $350.00 $0.00 $99.95 $0.00 $155.00 $20.00
WARM $100.00 $0.00 $69.95 $0.00 $70.00 $20.00
ELECTIONS $55.00 $0.00 $29.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
ADULT PROBATION $150.00 $20.00 $69.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
ADULT PROB BPORT $75.00 $20.00 $35.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
PRECINCT 4 BARN $100.00 $20.00 $49.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
FINANCIAL BLDG $100.00 $20.00 $45.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
COUNTY CLERK $145.00 $20.00 $54.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
COURTHOUSE $250.00 $20.00 $79.95 $0.00 $125.00 $20.00
JP#1 $85.00 $20.00 $54.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
JP#3 $85.00 $20.00 $54.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
PRECINCT 1 BARN $100.00 $20.00 $49.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
PUBLIC WORKS $65.00 $20.00 $35.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
PW YELLOW BLDG $75.00 $20.00 $39.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
TAX OFFICE $75.00 $20.00 $39.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
EXTENSION OFFICE $80.00 $20.00 $45.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
ASSET CONTROL $65.00 $20.00 $35.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
JUVENILE PROB $80.00 $20.00 $39.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
EMS $130.00 $20.00 $59.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
PRECINCT 3 BARN $100.00 $20.00 $54.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
EMS BOYD $75.00 $20.00 $35.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
ANIMAL CONTROL $100.00 $20.00 $59.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
BPORT ANNEX $130.00 $20.00 $69.95 $0.00 $55.00 $20.00
COMM DEV BLDG $75.00 $20.00 $39.95 $0.00 $45.00 $20.00
RAT/MOUSE $8.00 per station $35.00 per station | see below
TOTAL REG SPRAY $2,653.00 $1,289.80 $1,395.00

ALL ARE QUARTERLY SPRAY EXCEPT 1ST 3 ARE MONTHLY

All-Rid has an exception to fleas which will be extra charge




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-011
ROAD REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 6, 2015

Price per hour NO BID

Price per 8 hr day

Price per 10 hr day

Min hrs billed daily

materials

minimum

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-009

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 6, 2015

MR Bt

PEST CONTROL

M-l PWF w.y(\ oGl

Reg Add Reg Add
SOIJAIL 250 ® 495 O (55 0%
WARM (OO o) (.95 [ 70 /[
ELECTIONS S5 O l3aas \ SS (
ADULT PROBATION | 150 07 | (A37 \ 5T \
ADULT PROBBPORT | 7S 4 7595 s
PRECINCT 4 BARN }OO N €q.9< SS
FINANCIAL BLDG 10O ) 4= .95 45
COUNTY CLERK s o4 9< ) l;
COURTHOUSE S0 “ 955 | 2AS |
JP#1 SN N | {495 L
JP#3 'S IR \ He 5
PRECINCT 1 BARN |OO | da 9+ \ | 5
PUBLIC WORKS S 29 95 \| 45
PW YELLOW BLDG 1S 2095 oL
TAX OFFICE 7S 295 ST
EXTENSION OFFICE X)l <Ay /1SS
ASSET CONTROL leS 3849 / <5
JUVENILE PROB %0 95 [ s
EMS ] 30 \ Y9 G5 | 5
PRECINCT 3 BARN 10O V| od g \ 33
EMS BOYD * [ s4as \ | 45
ANIMAL CONTROL [1DO s 159495 X' 573
BPORT ANNEX 150 > | waas N
COMM DEV BLDG 75 S 29495 ) 45
RAT/MOUSE AN el B L 0 ey o
TOTAL REG SPRAY A @& N

& B
ALL ARE QUARTERLY SPRAY EXCEPT 1ST 3 ARE MONTHLY (3




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-009

PEST CONTROL
Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 6, 2015

Reg Add Reg Add Reg Add

SO/MJAIL

WARM

ELECTIONS

ADULT PROBATION

ADULT PROB BPORT

PRECINCT 4 BARN

FINANCIAL BLDG

COUNTY CLERK

COURTHOUSE

JP#1

JP#3

PRECINCT 1 BARN

PUBLIC WORKS

PW YELLOW BLDG

TAX OFFICE

EXTENSION OFFICE

ASSET CONTROL

JUVENILE PROB

EMS

PRECINCT 3 BARN

EMS BOYD

ANIMAL CONTROL

BPORT ANNEX

COMM DEV BLDG

RAT/MOUSE

TOTAL REG SPRAY
ALL ARE QUARTERLY SPRAY EXCEPT 1ST 3 ARE MONTHLY
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s NNy,
/€ Emulsion Plants, L.L.G.

516 S. McLennan Loop
Eim Mott, Texas 76640
Phone (254) 829-0330 Fax (254) 829-0337

p2emulsions@sbegiobal.net

i
:

Salesman: Rk Webwms  Cell: &- }éo] ~ LW\

Product Price Sheet for \)Vse County: Effective 8]t lis
Product, Tanker FOB Plant Tanker FOB Cmm Tote/Drum(Plant)
P9 Prime “Lucky 7-RTU”.....$1.20/Gallon...... $1.45/Gallon.......... $1.40Gallon
Premixed, ready to use ;

P2 "Tack 41- RTU" .cccoaenee $1.65 Gallon......$1.90 Gallon.....ccees $1.85 Gallon
Premixed, ready to use

p2 “Prime 11 Concentrate”..$1 .99/Gallon...... $2.24IGaII{f>n .......... $2.18/Gallon
Mixes with 6 parts water to make a prime, 4 parts water t0 make a tack

TR ST——— $2.44IGallon. .......- $2.60/Gallon.......... $2.64/Gallon
Asphalt Base Stabilizer ;

P2 Rejuvenator.........c.---- $2.47/Gallon......... ¢$2.72/Gallon.......... $2.67/Gallon
Asphalt Rejuvenator

O YR ——— 62.74/Gallon.........$2.99/Gallon..........52.94/Callon

All Weather Chip Seal Emulsion

CWP (Cold Weather Patch)..$2.74/Gallon...... $2.99/Gafflon .......... $2.94/Gallon
Year Round Pot Hole Patch Emulsion

P — (L $2.82/Gallon..........$2.77/Gallon

«Road Over Coat” for Chip Seal Roads
*All P2 products are Proprietary/Sole Source products formulated to fulfill
TxDot 300.2 particle charge procedure T59. Positive/Cationic. DO NC‘»::T CONTAMINATE WITH DIESEL.

Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 per hour there after.
Pump Charge {trucking charge): $80.00 if needed. k
Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons. .
Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential. i

CONTAINERS AVAILABLE FOR CUSTOMER CONVENIENCE when doing stpaller jobs than 2 tanker amount:
sTote” Containers (275 gallons size each) cost $129.00 per container. ;

“Drum"” Containers (55 gallons size each) cost $26.00 per drum.

Containers are re-usable and can be rinsed out, brought back, and be re-filled iat customer discretion.
Containers priced separate and sold only with orders for material.

*NOTE: In the event of national crisis or war, affecting extreme changes in pet:roleum pricing, P2 reserves the right to
change quoted or bid prices with 30 days proper written notice. :
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 16-600-011
ROAD REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 6, 2015

Price per hour / /

Price per 8 hr day / /

Price per 10 hr day / /

Min hrs billed daily / /

materials / /

minimum / /

notes / ’
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 16-600-012
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 6, 2015

Chico Limestone P&K Stone Hanson Trinity Materials
VENDOR Bridgeport, TX Chico, TX Dallas, TX Arlington, TX
8/4/15 9:52am 8/6/15 9:06am 8/4/15 2:06pm 8/3/15 10:002am
#1 Flex Base Per Ton #1 Flex Base 1 3/4" Base Flexbase Grade 1
ton/Bidder Loaded $5.40 $7.00 $6.25 no bid
#1 Flex Base Specialty Per Ton #2 Flex Base 1" minus base
ton/Bidder Loaded $5.40 no bid $6.25 no bid
Contractor Grade 2 Base #2 Flex Base Flexbase Grade 1
ton/Bidder Loaded $5.40 no bid $6.25 no bid
Small Washed Rock Type D Type D
ton/Bidder Loaded $8.50 no bid $10.00 no bid
Large Washed Rock Type C 1" utility 1"-#4 Utility Grade
ton/Bidder Loaded $8.50 $8.00 $10.00 no bid
Reject Base Reject
ton/Bidder Loaded $1.90 no bid no bid no bid
Rip Rap 12"
ton/Bidder Loaded $14.00 $14.00 no bid no bid
Rip Rap 18"
ton/Bidder Loaded $14.00 $16.00 no bid no bid
Rip Rap 24"
ton/Bidder Loaded $14.00 $18.00 no bid no bid
Chip Seal Type B Grade 3 County Chip Seal
ton/FOB no bid no bid $13.00 no bid
Chip Seal Type B Grade 4 County Chip Seal
ton/FOB no bid no bid $13.00 no bid
Chip Seal Type C Grade 3
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Chip Seal Type C Grade 4
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Minus Base 3/8" screenings
ton/vendor loaded no bid $7.00 no bid no bid
Minus Base 5/8"
ton/vendor loaded no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 3/4"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 5/8"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 1/2"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 3/8"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid $16.50
Pea Gravel #4
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel #8
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel torpedo
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Plant Location not stated not stated Bridgeport Paradise

Hanson Chip Seal Rock is modified
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PRECINCT 1

NO BID NO BID

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 16-600-012
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

NO BID

NO BID

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 2

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 16-600-012
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 6, 2015

VENDOR

(

iR e

%{ﬁM e,

#1 Flex Base Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded

otlo

‘716\)

(0.8

#1 Flex Base Specialty Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded

S MO

L. A5

Contractor Grade 2 Base

ton/Bidder Loaded

S HO

Small Washed Rock

ton/Bidder Loaded

8.5

Large Washed Rock

ton/Bidder Loaded

)

Reject Base

ton/Bidder Loaded

9D

Rip Rap 12"

ton/Bidder Loaded

Rip Rap 18"

ton/Bidder Loaded

Rip Rap 24"

ton/Bidder Loaded

Chip Seal Type B Grade 3

ton/FOB

Chip Seal Type B Grade 4

ton/FOB

Chip Seal Type C Grade 3

ton/FOB

Chip Seal Type C Grade 4

ton/FOB

Minus Base 3/8"

ton/vendor loaded

Minus Base 5/8"

ton/vendor loaded

Pea Gravel 3/4"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 5/8"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 1/2"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 3/8"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel #4

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel #8

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel torpedo

ton/FOB




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 16-600-012
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

PRECINCT 1

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 2

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location
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