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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 14-613-044
SALE-DUMP TRUCK

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

Evelyn Wolfe Martin Truck Grove Trucks Bruckner
Boyd, TX Boyd, TX Grand Prairie, TX Fort Worth, TX
7/25/2014 4:07pm  8/1/2014 8:59am 8/4/2014 10:51am  8/5/2014 10:56am

Price for Truck $8,600.00 $7,601.00 $6,150.00 $5,500.00




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 14-613-044
SALE-DUMP TRUCK
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

Lane Construction Lane Construction
VENDOR Roanoke, TX Roanoke, TX
8/7114 9:53am 8/7/114 9:53am
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphalt, type D $53.75 no bid $50.75 all delivered prices
High Performance Asphalt to all precincts
Concrete no bid no bid no bid $1.50 per ton 1-10 miles
Hot mix asphalt, type 8 $46.50 no bid $43.75 $.21 per ton ea add mile
Hot mix asphalt, type C $49.50 no bid $46.25
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.50 no bid $41.75
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $48.25 no bid $44.25
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $52.50 no bid $48.75
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid
[PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D $53.75 no bid $50.75
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $46.50 no bid $43.75
Hot mix asphalt, type C $49.50 no bid $46.25
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.50 no bid $41.75
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $48.25 no bid $44.25
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $52.50 no bid $48.75
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid
PRECINCT #3
Hot mix asphalt, type D $53.75 no bid $50.75
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $46.50 no bid $43.75
Hot mix asphalt, type C $49.50 no bid $46.25
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.50 no bid $41.75
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $48.25 no bid $44.25
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $52.50 no bid $48.75
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid
'PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $53.75 no bid $50.75
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $46.50 no bid $43.75
Hot mix asphalt, type C $49.50 no bid $46.25
HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphait Type B $45.50 no bid $41.75
Warm Mix Asphait Type C $48.25 no bid $44.25
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $52.50 no bid $48.75
Coid Mix Asphalt no bid no bid no bid
PLANT LOCATION Justin, TX Chico, TX




INVITATION TO BID 15-600-001

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

Austin Asphait APAC
VENDOR Irving, TX Dallas, TX

8/7/14 9:10am 8/6/14 2:01pm

[PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalt, type D $50.50 $58.00 $48.00 1-5 miles $4.00 per ton

High Performance Asphalt $.30 per ton ea add mile

Concrete no bid no bid $92.50

Hot mix asphalt, type B $45.00 $52.50 $44.00

Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $57.50 $46.00

HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid

HMCL Type D no bid no bid $72.50

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.75 $53.25 $47.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $50.75 $58.25 $49.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $61.25 $58.75 $51.00

Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $72.50

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D $50.50 $57.50 $48.00

High Performance Asphalt

Concrete no bid no bid $92.50

Hot mix asphalt, type B $45.00 $52.00 $44.00

Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $57.00 $46.00

HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid

HMCL Type D no bid no bid $72.50

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.75 $52.75 $47.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $50.75 $57.75 $49.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $51.25 $58.25 $51.00

Cold Mix Asphatt no bid no bid $72.50

PRECINCT #3

Hot mix asphalt, type D $50.50 $59.50 $48.00

High Performance Asphalt

Concrete no bid no bid $92.50

Hot mix asphalt, type B $45.00 $54.00 $44.00

Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $59.00 $46.00

HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid

HMCL Type D no bid no bid $72.50

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.75 $54.75 $47.00

Warm Mix Asphait Type C $50.75 $59.75 $49.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $51.25 $60.25 $51.00

Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $72.50

PRECINCT #4

Hot mix asphalt, type D $50.50 $57.00 $48.00

High Performance Asphait

Concrete no bid no bid $92.50

Hot mix asphalt, type B $45.00 $51.50 $44.00

Hot mix asphalt, type C $50.00 $56.50 $46.00

HMCL Type C no bid no bid no bid

HMCL Type D no bid no bid $72.50

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $45.75 $52.25 $47.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $50.75 $57.25 $49.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $51.25 $57.75 $51.00

Coid Mix Asphalt no bid no bid $72.50

PLANT LOCATION Bridgeport, TX Chico, TX

Austin Asphalt-350 ton minimum per day or $3000.00 plant start up fee




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-001
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

| Reynolds Asphalt

VENDOR Euless, TX

| 8/6/14 10:01am
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT “DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.81 $67.79
High Performance Asphait
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $52.95 $62.93
Hot mix asphalt, type C $57.81 $67.79
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalit Type D no bid no bid
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.81 $67.79
High Performance Asphalt
Concrele no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $52.95 $62.93
Hot mix asphalt, type C $57.81 $67.79
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D no bid no bid
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PRECINCT #3
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.81 $67.79
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $52.95 $62.93
Hot mix asphalt, type C $57.81 $67.79
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D no bid no bid
Coid Mix Asphatt no bid no bid
[PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $57.81 $67.79
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $52.95 $62.93
Hot mix asphalt, type C $57.81 $67.79
HMCL Type C no bid no bid
HMCL Type D no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D no bid no bid
Cold Mix Asphalt no bid no bid
PLANT LOCATION Saginaw, TX

Reynolds Haul Rates based on 22 ton minimum using flowboys



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

000 Pt

VENDOR

kaune Conshructus_

PRECINCT #1

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalt, type D

e

HSOIH-rn Ei©

MQg 2

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

—

Hot mix asphalt, type B

d

Hot mix asphalt, type C

4 SD
J44.S0

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

=30

[
!

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

4&.2S

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

52 <D

i

Cold Mix Asphalt

))\H‘ll"

s

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

<)

Hot mix asphalt, type C

[~

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

o~
S

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #3

~—

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

[~

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphait Type C

)‘Q_)
==
NS
)
\ L
AN

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #4

L

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

L] N

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PLANT LOCATION

TR —

Chicn




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR .
Puston Asphack APAC. Pt
K APlaud
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON W 253D to .
Hot mix asphalt, type D . So CE.OOD LK. UD
High Performance Asphait — .
Cogncrete ° _ q 250
Hot mix asphalt, type B H45, GO éQcTO e
Hot mix asphalt, type C 50.80 .50 OO
HMCL Type C — — —
HMCL Type D — — 12-SO
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B 45,1 25 1$H7.80
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C 5075 .S &0
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D SLAS SBAS SLEO
Cold Mix Asphait — — BFE=S)
PRECINCT #2 N a
Hot mix asphatt, type D SO0 5150 /ST a)
High Performance Asphalt —_
Concrete - -
Hot mix asphat, type B {60y S 00 {
Hot mix asphalt, type C SO.60 <700 \
HMCL Type C — — \
HMCL Type D — — |
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B 9.1 =V RE) /
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C =Ny S2.7% /
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D 9.5 NN JAGRN
Cold Mix Asphalt — — [ >
PRECINCT #3 [ e
Hot mix asphalt, fype D S0-50 =6 | {(—
High Performance Asphalt — \ i >©
Concrete —_—
Hot mix asphatt, type B s, 60 =d.0o N P
Hot mix asphalt, type C S0 9D <Q O Noe—
HMCL Type C — — \
HMCL Type D -~ - ] ¢
Warm Mix Asphait Type B 4,75 S¢S AN =
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C 0.5 a3 / N\
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D S5 LoD. 5 /
Cold Mix Asphalt —_— — {
PRECINCT #4 L
Hot mix asphalt, type D <, <0 SO0 AN
High Performance Asphait ‘ \
Concrete —
Hot mix asphalt, type B U G Si.50 )
Hot mix asphalt, type C ST - DO /
HMCL Type C —~ — /
HMCL Type D — -~ (
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B 4dsS I 225 \
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C S0OS 5735 )
Warm Mix Asphait Type D S ST /
Cold Mix Asphalt — = C
PLANT LOCATION [l ZOYE =2 (OO




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR

et

PRECINCT #1

DELIVERED

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalt, type D

.9

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

————

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

repic

HMCL Type D

—1

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #3

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphait, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #4

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphait Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphait Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

|

PLANT LOCATION

\n‘@v/y\ N TT




VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-002
BRIDGE BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thurdsay, August 7, 2014

PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT W/MATERIALS

Harris Welding
Springtown, TX
8/6/14 8:36am

$975.00 $2,350.00




VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-002
BRIDGE BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thurdsay, August 7, 2014

PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT W/MATERIALS

HANH W

Qs A0
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR

Sun Coast Resources
Houston, TX
8/6/14 10:41am

Indigo Energy
Alpharetta, GA
8/7/14 9:55am

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1455 0.2562
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1455 0.2366
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0826 .0039/.2275*
PRECINCT #2

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1455 0.2562
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1455 0.2366
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .2400 .0039/.2275*
PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .5400 0.2562
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin .5400 0.2366
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0633 .0039/.2275*
PRECINCT #4

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .6000 0.2562
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin .6000 0.2366
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0685 .0039/.2275*

Sun Coast exception: cannot monitor and change to billing
Indigo Energy first diesel price is for full 7500 gal transport load or will be second higher price




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Atlas Oil Company SC Fuels
Taylor, Mi Orange, CA

VENDOR 8/7/114 9:55am 8/7114 8:14am
PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0095/1.1000* .0011
PRECINCT #2
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0095/1.1000* 0.0033
PRECINCT #3
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0095/1.1000* -0.0014
PRECINCT #4
Unleaded Gasoiine (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 1.1000 no bid
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0085/1.1000" 0.0083

Atlas diesel pricing depends on first price Transport deliver or second price tankwagon deliver, also exception to the legal responsibilities
for defective products or contractual obligation
SC Fuels minimum order of 7500 gal

]
!



VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

IPO Fuel Distribution
irvine, CA
8/6/14 2:23pm

Mansfield Oil Company
Gainesville, GA
8/6/14 1:34pm

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin_ no bid 0.6523
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin no bid 0.6523
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0060 .0470
PRECINCT #2

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin no bid 0.2923
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin no bid 0.2923
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0100 0.0198
PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasoline {89 Octane) Profit Margin no bid 0.2923
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin no bid 0.2923
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0042 0.0027
PRECINCT #4

Unleaded Gasoline (83 Octane) Profit Margin_ no bid 0.2923
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin no bid 0.2923
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0075 0.0198

IPC will negotiate fees(not included) for monitoring tanks
Mansfield Oil has additional flat rate fees depending on amount delivered: less than 2500 $2.75, 2500-4999 $5.50, 5000-7999 $8.62,

8000-9999 $11.00




VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Douglass Distributing
Sherman, TX
8/1/14 2:55pm

Martin Eagle Oil Company
Denton, TX
8/1/14 8:59am

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
No. 2 Diese! Profit Margin .0200 -.0037
PRECINCT #2

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0800 -.0037
PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0200 -.0037
PRECINCT #4

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .0800 0.0387
Unleaded Gasoline (33 Octane) Profit Margin -0800 0.0387
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .0200 -.0037

Martin Eagle has an addendum
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Wholesate Gaseline . Laesel Fuei . Korosene (WATA

=27 MARTIN. EAGLE

Wise County Addendum
Bid No. # 15-600-003

Martin Eagle Oil Company, Inc. makes this offer with mark
up/down as listed on your bid page using the Dallas Metro
Contract Benchmark Gross Average Rack price for date of
delivery 10:00 AM EST pricing.

Unleaded is based on the products delivered out of the DFW

area:
Gasoline is RFG with 10 % ethanol & diesel is TXLED ULSD with

15 PPM sulfur. -

It is not stated in the bid but several refiners, exchanges;
terminals are now using bio up to 5 % as an additive with the
approval of the TCEQ. If the county has no problem from time
to time you may end up with this product unless otherwise
stated. The benefit is a little off the Texas Fuel tax. It would be a
fraction of a cent up to one penny off for using it as a
renewable fuel source.

Attached copy of OPIS pricing page off a report we will use.
Martin Eagle, at no cost to Wise County, will install tank
monitors to monitor your product level, set up the orders and
make deliveries that will greatly reduce MEO trips and the
possibility that you have an outage. The information from the
monitors can only be viewed by you and MEO. It tells when a
dump has been made, we ping each site once a day. Allows only
those that you want to see your fuel information by using a

2700 JAMES » DENTON, TEXAS 76205 + (340) 383-2351 o METRO (97:) 434-7351 « FAX {940) 38:-934%

OIL COMPANY, INC. 0
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\_

OIL COMPANY, INC.

secure log in and password. We provide replacement,
materials, batteries, cost of monitor, cost of service and your
cost is zero as long as MEO is allowed within your guidelines to
do the orders, delivery and the billing. On Keep filled program
we shop and deliver on the best possible market day that we
can, we delivery your product in a manner that benefits Wise

County and MEO.

We have attached a Taxes & Fees, State or Federal that we add
to all our bids in Texas & Oklahoma.

Phillip Childers Il
Vice President of Sales

5700 JAMES « DENTON. TEXAS 76205 = (940)) 383-2351 « METRO( 9/2) 434-7351 » FA A (940) 3r0-57547




Whotesate Gasaline . Diesel Fuel . Kerosene ] (il

7= MARTIN-EAGLE

Taxes & Fees, State &/or Federal

Any Tax and/or fee that is established by a State or
Federal agency will appear as a separate line item if the State or
Federal agency deems it to be applicable to your organization '
or any entity adjoined to this agreement. Any changes,
additions, subtractions from any fee or tax will appear in the

line item.

| Federal L.U.S.T. fee is a Federal charge that is currently at
f $ 0.0010 per gallon. The fee is called Leaking Underground

i

Storage Fee.

Federal Oil Spill Liability fee is based on each petroleum
product and the amount of renewable fuel present.

Diesel & gasoline $ 0.001905
Gasoline 10 % Ethanol $0.001714
Gasoline 70 % (winter)  $0.000572
Gasoline 85 % (summer) $0.000286
Biodiesel B-5 $0.001810
Biodiesel B-10 $0.001714
Biodiesel B -20 $0.001524

2700 JAMES » UENTOM, TEXAS 76205 » (940) 383-2351 « METRO (97:) 4 53-7351 » FAX {940) 382-4342 /,","



" Wholesale Gasoline . Diesel Frel . Kerosene . (il s

=27 MARTIN-EAGLE

OIL COMPANY, INC.

Petroleum Products Delivery Fee. Texas fee that was supposed
to be removed recently but the State has continued to
administer it to the Petroleum users. This fee is invoiced on the
net gallons delivered.

2,550 or Less gallons $3.75

2,500 to 5,000 gallons S 7.50

5,000 to 8,000 gallons $11.75

8,000 to 10,000 gallons $15.00

Each 5,000 gallon increment on 10,000 or more is 7.50 for each
increase.

For Gasoline deliveries of at least 7,000 but less than 8,000 gals
(whether single product or split load multi products) special
rules apply.

*if gasoline portion of delivery is less than 7000 gals the fee is
$11.75

** if the gasoline portion is at least 7,000 and total load is
presumed to be 8,000 gals then the fee is $15.00.

Oklahoma underground storage fee is $ 0.0100

Federal Fuel Taxes:

$0.1830 Gasoline  $ 0.2430 Diesel
Texas Fuel Taxes:

$0.2000 Gasoline  $0.2000 Diesel
Oklahoma Fuel Taxes:

50.1600 Gasoline  $ 0.1300 Diesel

2700 JAMES » DENTON, TEXAS 76205 (940) 383-2351 « METRQ (972) 434-7351 » FAX (940) 382-9342




Wholesale Criaoline . Lesel el . Kerosene v CIHEN

- - OIL COMPANY, INC. | \

Any tax or fee that is established by a State or Federal agency
will be applied to your invoice if applicable. If it new, reduced,
increased or eliminated it will be applied to your invoice with

any change as a separate line item.

Al 5700 JAMES o DENION, TEXAS 76205 « (940) 383-2351 ¢ METRO (3773 3317851 « FAX {9/10) 3829342
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR

Surleast

\ndino

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per gallon profit nargin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 1 ANSS -Pwv2
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 4SS e\ V)

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin LOF20, -00x K
PRECINCT #2 -

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin NS wASoR
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin | (48S Q30

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin oM o0 L0027 ¥
PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin .SUYDO o2
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin -SYoOo <230

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin -0L33 QO
PRECINCT #4 i \
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin 00O PINERY
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin - LOOOD 230

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin -0%S -CUA #

< =.227S




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR oy ALty 0 Ee0n

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per galion
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin - OO0 Al\NpI.A
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin (00D INUOU)
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin < 0045 [ TamiWapen t-(ea] ~OD[[ ¥
PRECINCT #2 ’ ° N2
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin AN AL/
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin _ R .
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin \ Neetta-s
PRECINCT #3 \ . A
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin \ JAV/A) &Vﬁ 8]
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin . hddia
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin — DO &
PRECINCT #4 Lo D
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin AN )
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin \| / A
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin ~ ..@@Wwb P
B Touk ,.bﬁmwoJ/

(. 00O




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR %u@ zﬁ.\sbm& g

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per galion profit Etmm: cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin Y\ 25 SRS
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin NIV oS3
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin -0 0D -H70)
PRECINCT #2 A

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin N4 29D
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin oUWV Q3
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin -O® 100 -O1a®
PRECINCT #3 o

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin ANNARAY TS 12833
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin i (O 23
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin OO Z YO
PRECINCT #4

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin A N0 A AN I 23
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin A NS
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin OO 0Ly




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

Douglas Doty

VENDOR ZQ.\WT,\S MM@@ 9
PRECINCT #1 prdfit margin cents per galign profit margin centg per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin <0 SO 1
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin OO0 JO387
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin - OAOO - . 0037
PRECINCT #2
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin . OO0 cO3E7
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin « OFO0 ‘O
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin VO ¥OO —~ 0537
PRECINCT #3
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin OSSO <O
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin O KOD -62%7
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 260 — O3
PRECINCT #4
Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin _ ,O¥(5D O8N
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin * (O STT0 . O3&T
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin - O260 <0037




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-004
CULVERTS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

METAL CULVERTS The Railroad Yard Wilson Culverts Lowery Wholesale
Stillwater, OK Elkhart, TX Paradise, TX
VENDOR 7/31/14 4:02pm 8/6/2014 4:10pm 8/5/14 4:38pm
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
12 inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $7.056 $8.30
15 inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $8.81 $9.96
12 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid no bid $8.30
15 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid no bid $9.96
18 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $14.52 $12.46
24.inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $18.68 $15.78
30 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $23.38 $21.68
36 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $28.46 $24.08
48 inch, 12 ga. 3"x1" no bid $45.10 $42.01
all changed to 16 ga.
RAILROAD CAR CULVERTS
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
5'0" to 5'5" 26' to 28’ $195.00 no bid no bid
6'0" to 711" 32' to 35’ $240.00 no bid no bid
8'0" to 8'5" 32'to 35' $270.00 no bid no bid
8'6" to 8'11" 38" to 45' $270.00 no bid no bid
9'0" to 9'11" 40' to 45' $270.00 no bid no bid
10'0" & greater 40" & longer $275.00 no bid no bid
Railroad Yard first two noted R&W Pipe
CONCRETE CULVERTS
Price Price Price
36"48" 6' no bid no bid no bid




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-004
CULVERTS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

METAL CULVERTS
VENDOR éﬁeﬁ&» 49\6@ 6;@5@9@%
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
121inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" ~ .c%
15inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" AN %.Xl .
12 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N\ — ¥.30
15 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N\ _ Qaw
18 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N\ 4.5 2.
24 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N 15wy (£.%
30inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N\ 2238 ALK
36 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N\ 2% 4o 24 .0%
48inch, 12 ga. 3T ~ H45.10 42 O\
RAILROAD CAR CULVERTS
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot y Price per linear foot

50" to 5'5" 26' to 28’ .95 R AN

6'0" to 7'11" 32' to 35' DO \ N\

8'0" to 8'5" 32'to 35' 270 N\ N\

8%6" to 811" 38 to 45 2710 AN N\

90" to 911" 40 to 45' 200 N\ A\
10'0" & greater 40' & longer EREY N\ N\

CONCRETE CULVERTS
Price Price N\ Price \
[ 36"-48" [ 6 ~ N\ N\

(v

d&(



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-005
HAULING ROAD MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

LO Transport RJ Cleveland
Paradise, TX Paradise, TX
VENDOR 8/6/14 2:33pm 8/6/14 9:53am
diesel fuel price range
$2.50-$2.99 $85.00 $70.00
$3.00-83.49 $87.00 $74.50
$3.50-$3.99 $87.00 $78.50
$4.00-$4 .49 $90.00 $83.50
$4.50-$4.99 $92.50 $87.50
$5.00-$5.49 $95.00 $90.00




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-005
HAULING ROAD MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR %@ @ﬂ bemo&\ %J Q?C@Pfr%

diesel fuel price range
$2.50-$2.99 5. OO N1O.00
$3.00-$3.49 57 OO SO
$3.50-$3.99 1. 50 5. SO
$4.00-$4.49 0O- OO 03-o
$4.50-$4.99 g2 3So 5750
$5.00-$5.49 QAY.s0 30 .00




Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

WISE

COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-566-006

JAIL FOOD

VENDOR DATE TIME PRICE PER MEAL
Five Star Correctional
Dallas, TX 8/5/2014 11:14am $ 160

s e



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-566-006
JAIL FOOD

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR

DATE

TIME

PRICE PER MEAL

5 St Conechim

~—

| .00




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-007
MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

Texas Road and Sign

McKinney, TX
VENDOR 8/5/14 3:3%pm
price per gal .66
price per tanker $3,097.53

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-007
MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR \?k@ g M nwrwm«(

price per gal

price per tanker

A9

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-008
ROAD OILS, ASPHALTS, EMULSIONS, AND LIQUIDS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

Heartland Asphalt Professional Coating Rooker Asphait

Western Emulsions

Hurst, TX Cedar Hill, TX Fort Worth, TX Temple, TX

VENDOR 8/7/14 9:27am 8/6/14 10:35am 8/5/14 10:21am 7128114 4:17pm
Type of Materials delivered |FOB plant| delivered [ FOB plant| delivered | FOB plant| delivered | FOB plant
CRS-2 $ 217{%$ 2.05| nobid nobid |$ 245] nobid |$ 233! nobid
CRS-2H $ 217{% 205| nobid nobid |$ 245| nobid |{$ 2.33( nobid
CRS-2P $ 292({$ 280| nobid nobid {$ 3.05| nobid |$ 3.05} nobid
CSS-1H $ 2171% 205} nobid nobid |$ 245 nobid |$ 235] nobid
AEP $ 317[($% 3.05] nobid nobid |[$ 325! nobid |$ 3.15) nobid
MC-30 Prime Ol no bid no bid no bid nobid |$ 431]| nobid no bid no bid
EC-30 Prime Oil Alternative no bid no bid no bid nobid | $ 3.00] nobid no bid no bid
AC-5 Asphalt no bid no bid no bid nobid |$ 265] nobid no bid no bid
AC-10 Asphalt $ 282|%$ 272]| nobid nobid |$ 265] nobid no bid no bid
AC-10 Asphalt witire rubber no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MC-800 no bid no bid no bid nobid |$ 4.21]| nobid no bid no bid
HPCPE-50 gal County PU own tote no bid no bid nobid |$ 496] nobid no bid no bid no bid
HPCPE-50 gal Vendor provide tote no bid no bid nobid {$ 547| nobid no bid no bid no bid
HPCPE-50 gal delivered no bid nobid |$ 5.72| nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid
HPCPE-50 gal tanker delivered no bid nobid | $ 4.80}| nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid
fasblack non polymer modified $ 212|$%$ 200] nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
fasblack polymer modified $ 262{% 250| nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
MAC-150 $ 252(% 240! nobid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Trackless Tack no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid nobid |$ 2.75| nobid
Demurrage Minimum 2 hrs 0 2 hrs 2hrs
Time Limit $80.00 thereafter $90.00 thereafter $80.00 thereafter
Minimum Freight 5500 gallons 4000 gallons tanker 23 tons 23 tons
Pump Charge $80.00 $0.00 $150.00 $80.00
Plant Location Saginaw Cedar Hill, TX Ft Worth, Waco, Temple, TX

Wynnewood




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-008
ROAD OILS, ASPHALTS, EMULSIONS, AND LIQUIDS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

t@c% and

fspha It

VENDOR _ g%&mﬁﬁ%@obﬁ% S %MQG,EI
Type of Materials Fots Piandt | " Deolivord U J DT
CRS-2 <2 0N /aa( 217200 ORYSS
CRS-2H Y 2. AYS
CRS-2P 2-XD S 3O
CSS-1H 2 O 217 -4
AEP 3.00 2] I- N
MC-30 Prime Oil _ — L.3]
EC-30 Prime Oil Alternative — - Z- 50
AC-5 Asphalt — — 2405
AC-10 Asphalt =270 = 2 25
AC-10 Asphalt wi/tire rubber —_ / —_—
MC-800 — ~N_/ . Y]
HPCPE-50 gal County PU own tote — N/ H Qb Sy[s. 2] —
HPCPE-50 gal Vendor provide tote — /\ / \ —
HPCPE-50_gal delivered — AN _ —
HPCPE-50 gal tanker delivered — o T~ \
Demurrage Minimum ;
Time Limit 2hr 50T ) / Shr 40 OO\ Pm.@@\ﬂ
Minimum Freight 2500 g 4L G ] Mo P
Pump Charge £ .08 — 196 .00 .
Plant Location SCRONOUIAD C eAdon 4+ I =G, gw [Dunuwoed
Fust Black DEO Dl
FastBlack m 230 .
MAC- 1S o=
=4O

EN ]



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-008
ROAD OILS, ASPHALTS, EMULSIONS, AND LIQUIDS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR
Type of Materials { ol ureiod
CRS2 R
CRS-2H SR
CRS-2P 2.0%
CSS-1H RS
AEP 5
MC-30 Prime Oil \ /
EC-30 Prime Qil Alternative \/
AC-5 Asphalt N\ /
AC-10 Asphalt \ XY
AC-10 Asphalt w/tire rubber /N\\
MC-800 7 3\
HPCPE-50 gal County PU own tote /  / \
HPCPE-50 gal Vendor provide tote v O\ '\
HPCPE-50 gal delivered N
HPCPE-50 gal tanker delivered
Demurrage Minimum
Time Limit nb.@\\m WOB;O \kmé(ﬂ
Minimum Freight 23Ty~
Pump Charge P e
Plant Location e 0o
i \»)
“haclkly» tack- D15




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-009
ROAD REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

NO BIDS

Price per hour

Price per 8 hr day

Price per 10 hr day

Min hrs billed daily

materials per gal

minimum gallons

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 15-600-009
ROAD REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

NoBds Roc'd

Price per hour

Price per 8 hr day

Price per 10 hr day

Min hrs billed daily

materials per gal

minimum gallons

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-010
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

Chico Limestone Hanson Martin Marietta
VENDOR Bridgeport, TX Irving, TX Bedford, TX
8/5/14 4:08pm 8/514 2.35pm 8/7/14 9:05am

#1 Flex Base Per Ton #1 Flex Base Flexbase grade 1
ton/Bidder Loaded $4.90 $5.75 no bid
#1 Flex Base Specialty Per Ton #2 Flexbase 1" minus base
ton/Bidder Loaded $4.90 $5.75 no bid
Contractor Grade 2 Base none given Flexbase grade 1 _grade 2 flexbase
ton/Bidder Loaded $4.90 $5.75 $7.00
Small Washed Rock Type “D" Type D asphalt Agg
ton/Bidder Loaded $7.45 $9.50 no bid
Large Washed Rock Type "C" 1"-#4 Utility Grade #57
ton/Bidder Loaded $7.45 $9.50 $11.00
Reject Base Reject
ton/Bidder Loaded $1.50 no bid no bid
Rip Rap 12" none given RipRap
ton/Bidder Loaded $12.50 no bid $15.00
Rip Rap 18" none given RipRap
ton/Bidder Loaded $12.50 no bid $16.00
Rip Rap 24" none given RipRap
ton/Bidder Loaded $12.50 no bid $17.00
Chip Seal Type B Grade 3 county chip seal*
ton/FOB no bid $12.70 no bid
Chip Seal Type B Grade 4 county chip seal* graded rock
ton/FOB no bid $12.70 $17.00
Chip Seal Type C Grade 3
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Chip Seal Type C Grade 4 __graded rock
ton/FOB no bid no bid $17.00
Minus Base 3/8" SCN
ton/vendor loaded $4.90 no bid no bid
Minus Base 5/8" SCN
ton/vendor loaded $4.90 no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 3/4”
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 5/8"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 1/2"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 3/8"
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel #4
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel #8
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel torpedo
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid




' WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-010
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

PRECINCT 1 NO BID ALL NO BID ALL NO BID ALL

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 2

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 15-600-010
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR

#1 Flex Base Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded

4.0

#1 Flex Base Specialty Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded

K90

Contractor Grade 2 Base

ton/Bidder Loaded

440

Small Washed Rock

ton/Bidder Loaded

RSy

Large Washed Rock

ton/Bidder Loaded

TNS

Reject Base

ton/Bidder Loaded

[ 56>

Rip Rap 12"

ton/Bidder Loaded

150

Rip Rap 18"

ton/Bidder Loaded

12O

Rip Rap 24"

ton/Bidder Loaded

1

Chip Seal Type B Grade 3

ton/FOB

——

Chip Seal Type B Grade 4

ton/FOB

Chip Seal Type C Grade 3

ton/FOB

Chip Seal Type C Grade 4

ton/FOB

Minus Base 3/8"

ton/vendor loaded

190

Minus Base 5/8"

ton/vendor loaded

a0

Pea Gravel 3/4"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 5/8"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 1/2"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 3/8"

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel #4

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel #8

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel torpedo

ton/FOB




PRECINCT 1

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-010

ROCK AND BASE MATER

ALS

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphait Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 2

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-010
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR M {Y\Md?&'h

#1 Flex Base Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded N

#1 Flex Base Specialty Per Ton —

ton/Bidder Loaded

Contractor Grade 2 Base

ton/Bidder Loaded 1.0

Small Washed Rock

ton/Bidder Loaded —

Large Washed Rock

ton/Bidder Loaded IL- 6O

Reject Base

ton/Bidder Loaded e

Rip Rap 12"

ton/Bidder Loaded 1.

Rip Rap 18"

ton/Bidder Loaded o . OO

Rip Rap 24"

ton/Bidder Loaded (1.0

Chip Seal Type B Grade 3

ton/FOB

Chip Seal Type B Grade 4

ton/FOB 171-S0)

Chip Seal Type C Grade 3

ton/FOB e

Chip Seal Type C Grade 4

ton/FOB M) OO

Minus Base 3/8"
ton/vendor loaded A\

Minus Base 5/8" \

ton/vendor loaded N\

Pea Gravel 3/4" \

ton/FOB N\

Pea Gravel 5/8" N

ton/FOB N\

Pea Gravel 1/2" N

ton/FOB \

Pea Gravel 3/8" N\

ton/FOB N\

Pea Gravel #4 \

ton/FOB N\

Pea Gravel #8 \

ton/FOB N\

Pea Gravel torpedo

ton/FOB




PRECINCT 1

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-010

{ROCK AND BASE MATER

ALS

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 2

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphait Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalit Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-011
SCRAP METAL SALE FOR PRECINCTS PUBLIC WORKS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR PICKUP PRICE PER TON DELIVERED PRICE PER TON ALUMINUM RECYCLE
Dectaur lron & Metal
Decatur, TX $ 150.00 $ 180.00 $.55/b
8/6/14 1:24pm
Ricks Metal
Bridgeport, TX $ 200.00 $200.00 $.45/1b

8/6/14 11:21am

Bridgeport Iron & Metal
Bridgeport, TX $ 182.00 $193.00 $.45/lb clean

8/4/14 10:51am $.16/Ib dirty




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 15-600-011

SCRAP METAL SALE FOR PRECINCTS PUBLIC WORKS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR PICKUP PRICE PER TON DELIVERED PRICE PER TON ALUMINUM RECYCLE
Lo eatua Uk | 50. €0 [ K0 .00 5 [ powundl
Ry 20060 0. 0D 455 o,
Cleam U
Bt | now [ €2.60 [Q3-6D Doty ;mxms




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-012
UNIFORM SERVICE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2(

VENDOR
DATE & TIME
G&K Services Unifirst
Coppell, TX Ft Worth, TX
TYPE OF UNIFORM 8/7/14 9:24am 8/5/2014 9:29am
100% cotton shirts 214 24
denim shirts(Big Ben or equal) .391 .27
shirts (65 polyester/35 cotton) 145 18
oxford shirts (button down collar) 218 23
chambray shirts (pearl snaps) .223 27
miniplaid shirts or equal 195 .34
exxon shirts .145 23
gm shirts .145 31
jackets(permalined or equal) .27 .55
wranglers 473 * see below
big ben jeans or equal .244 .29
pants (65 polyester/35 cotton) .145 22
coveralls 409 .62 coverall/.55 overall
3x4 mats 1.08 2.50
4x6 mats 2.16 3.50
3x10 mats 2.70 4.25
3x5 scraper 1.56 2.00
18x18 wipers .037 .08
replacement 44 2% @.25
Bar Towels Q77 .14
replacement .64 2%@.35
60" dry mop 78 1.25
handlefframe 0 0
air freshener 2.12 1.70
scan/receipt no yes
starch yes/add $1.50 for heavy yes
days to provide 60 7-14

G&K auto replacement of 7% on shop towels and 2% on bar towels




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 15-600-012
UNIFORM SERVICE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 7, 2014

VENDOR
DATE & TIME

TYPE OF UNIFORM Q)‘ KSwe %ﬂ,& 5@3'1'

nedongd Poc puce

100% cotton shirts <2l .

denim shirts(Big Ben or equal) 2341 oy

shirts (65 polyester/35 cotton) A -8

oxford shirts (button down collar) e UE )

chambray shirts (pearl snaps) - D .27

miniplaid shirts or equal 05 .34

exxon shirts A4 « 23

gm shirts -ids » 3]
jackets(permalined or equal) 271 -5

wranglers 4D 2. (scQun.

big ben jeans or equal - 44 .25

pants (65 polyester/35 cotton) U 22

coveralls {9 oz oo 55
3x4 mats LOY 2350

4x6 mats NIV 2SO

3x10 mats 2.0 TINY

3x5 scraper L Sw A0

18x18 wipers O - ~OX
replacement RS e (@ ,25

Bar Towels LON NTD
replacement - oY EUNGEENY

60" dry mop 1K .25
handle/frame [®) @)

air freshener HEY .20

scan/receipt N©O Yoy

starch N es Yes . .
days to provide Vo 14 Calopddn Dcu/(?

Sgai i e  wasdio:
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¥ WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 14-566-045
JAIL SECURITY UPGRADE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

MCS Stanley

San Antonio, TX Irving, TX
8/7/14 9:54am 8/7/14 9:15am
fump sum price $74,907.00 $58,277.00

optional quote $88,171.00

but not listed on bid page,
no contract sample

notes submitted No references provided




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 14-566-045
JAIL SECURITY UPGRADE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 7, 2014

w¢f>>§> Stonle, MCS

lump sum price <5,2771°60 =%, 377 .90 14,407.90

QC./%,A <

notes

andton et mecki
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Wise County Sheriff's Office
Jail CCTV System Upgrade Meeting

.

Date Company Name Attending Person Phone Email
13- MCS Brion Hinkle ALD 495 $34¢ | phakle g mesdet, com
7.8 14| Sanley Secury Jich Phqun At 762673 | (ochue o0 @oshedin com




