WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 17-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS
Bid opening : 10:00 a.m,, Thursday, August 4, 2016

Austin Asphalt Reynolds Asphalt
VENDOR trving, TX Euless, TX

8/4/16 8:38am 8/2/16 9:12am
PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hol mix asphalt, type D $35.95 " see below for ail $52.00 $61.98
High Perfarmance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $35.50 $50.00 $59.98
Hot mix asphalt, type C $38.50 $52.00 $61.98
HMCL Type C $65.00 no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $35.50 $51.00 $60.98
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $38.50 $53.00 $62.98
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $39.95 $53.00 $62.98
Cold Mix Asphalt $65.00 na bid no bid
'PRECINGY #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D $30.95 $52.00 $61.98
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $35.50 $50.00 $59.98
Hot mix asphalt, type C $38.50 $52.00 $61.98
HMCL Type C $65.00 no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $35.50 $51.00 $60.98
Warm Mix Asphatt Type C $38.50 $53.00 $62.98
Warm Mix Asphait Type D $39.95 $53.00 $62.98
Cold Mix Asphalt $65.00 no bid no bid
[PREGINGT #3
Hot mix asphalt, type D $39.95 $52.00 $6198
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid no bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $35.50 $50.00 $59.93
Hot mix asphalt, type C $38.50 $52.00 $61.98
HMCL Type C $65.00 no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $35.50 $51.00 $60.98
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $38.50 $53.00 $62.98
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $35.95 $53.00 $62.98
Cold Mix Asphatt $65.00 no bid no bid
PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $39.95 $52.00 $61.98
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete no bid o bid no bid
Hot mix asphalt, type B $35.50 $50.00 $59.98
Hot mix asphalt, type C $38.50 $52.00 $61.98
HMCL Type C $65.00 no bid no bid
HMCL Type D $65.00 no bid no bid
Warm Mix Asphak Type B $35.50 $51.00 $60.98
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $38.50 $53.00 $62 98
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $39.95 $53.00 $62.98
Cold Mix Asphait 3$65.00 no bid no bid
PLANT LOCATION Bridgeport Saginaw

Austin Asphalt-delivered Haul Rate 1-5 miles from plant $4.
Austin Asphalt-Note is in the process of buildin
Nov 1, 2016 but could be delayed due to weath

delivered from Fort Worth plant at the same rates quoted above for delivery.
Reynolds Asphait-Haul Rate based on 22 ton minimum using flowboys. No Affidavit included with the bid.

.50 per ton, $.32 per ton ea additional mile
g a new plant that will produce thase materials, Estimated opening date is

er or unforseen circumstances. In the interim, they are offering the products
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WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 17-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

APAC
VENDOR Dallas, TX
8/3/116 3:05pm
[PRECINCT #1 FOB PLANT DELIVERED FOB PLANT DELIVERED
MATERIALS PER TON
Hot mix asphalt, type D $47.00 * see below for all
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete $95.00
Hot mix asphatt, type B }44.00
Hot mix asphalt, type C b46.00
HMCL Type C no bid
HMCL Type D $75.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $46.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $48.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $49.00
[Cotd Mix Asphalt $75.00
PRECINCT #2
Hot mix asphalt, type D $47.00
High Performance Asphalt
Concrete $95.00
Hot mix asphalt, type B $44.00
Hot mix asphalt, type C $46.00
HMCL Type C no bid
HMCL Type D $75.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type B $46.00
Warm Mix Asphall Typa C $48.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $49.00
Cold Mix Asphalt $75.00
PRECINCT #3
Hot mix asphait, type D $47.00
High Performance Asphalt
Concrele $95.00
Hot mix asphalt, type B $44.00
Hot mix asphalt, type C $46.00
HMCL Type C no bid
HMCL Type D $75.00
Wamm Mix Asphait Type B $46.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $43.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $49.00
Cold Mix Asphalt $75.00
PRECINCT #4
Hot mix asphalt, type D $47.00
High Performance Asphalt
Caoncrete $95.00
Hot mix asphalt, type B $44.00
Hot mix asphalt, type C $46.00
HMCL. Type C no bid
HMCL Type D $£75.00
Warm Mix Asphaht Type B $46.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type C $48.00
Warm Mix Asphalt Type D $49.00
Cold Mix Asphalt $75.00
PLANT LOCATION Chico

APAC Haul Rate 1-5 miles $5.00 per ton and $.30 per ton each additional mile
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VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Douglass Distributing
Sherman, TX
B8/3/16 1:59pm

Lykins Energy Solutions
Milford, OH
8/4/16 8:32am

PUBLIC WORKS profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 08 no bid

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .01 no bid
PRECINCT #1

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .01 0159
PRECINCT #2

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 01 .0159
PRECINCT #3

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .01 0159
PRECINCT #4

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin .01 .0159
MONITOR no information included included at no charge




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Sun Coast
Houston, TX
VENDOR ____8/4116 9:46am
PUBLIC WORKS profit margin cents per gailon profit margin cents per gallon
Unleaded Gasgcline (93 Octane) Profit Margin 0.13
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 0.13
PRECINCT #1
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 0.03
PRECINCT #2
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 0.03
PRECINCT #3
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 0.03
PRECINCT #4
No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin 0.0295
MONITOR $30.00 per monitor per month

Sun Coast has additional fees Jisted in attachment




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-004
CULVERTS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 2016

METAL CULVERTS Contech Wilson Culverts Forterra
Irving, TX Elkhart, TX Grand Prairie, TX
VENDOR 8/3/16 4:10pm 07129116 3:06pm 08/02/16 9:59am
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
12 inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" $9.00 $8.25 no bid
15inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" $11.25 $10.31 no bid
12inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid no bid ng bid
15inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid no bid no bid
18 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" no bid $17.00 no bid
24inch, 12ga. 2.66x1/2" $24.75 $21.86 ne bid
30.inch, 12 ga. 2.68x1/2" $30.75 $27 36 no bid
36inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" $36.75 $33.30 no bid
48 inch, 12 ga. 31" $55.50 $52.77 no bid

Contech freight $400.00 per truck and bid not signed.

RAILROAD CAR CULVERTS

Price per linear foot ~ Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
5'0"to 6'5" 26' to 28' no bid no bid no bid
6'0"to 7'11" 32'to 3§’ no bid no bid no bid
8'0" to 8'5" 32' to 3%’ no bid no bid no bid
8'6" to 8'11" 38" to 45' no bid no bid no bid
9'0" to 9'11" 40' to 45' no bid no bid no bid
10'0" & greater 40' & longer no bid no hid no bid




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-004

CULVERTS
CONCRETE CULVERTS
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
TXDOT #464 RCP
18" no bid . no bid $24.50
21" no bid ] no bid $29.40
24" no bid no bid $36.40
27" ne bid no bid $42.00
30" no bid no bid $49.70
33" no bid no bid $60.90
36" no bid no bid $72.80
39" no bid no bid $91.00
42" no bid no bid $100.80
48" no bid no bid $122.50
54" no bid no bid $163.80
60" no bid no bid $193.90
TXDOT #462 Box Culverts
3I%2 no bid no bid $105.70
33 no bid no bid $110.60
4'x2' no big no bid $124 .60
4'x3' no bid no bid $143.50
4'x4' no bid no bid $161.70
5x2' no bid no bid $170.80
5'%3' no bid no bid $179.20
5'%d’ no bid no bid $197.40
5'%5' no bid no bid $216.30
6'x3 no bid no bid $234.50
6'x4' no bid no bid $256.90
'x5' no bid ne bid $277.90
6'x6' ho bid no bid $299 .60




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-004

73 nobid  COEMERTS— o0 $289.10
7'x4' no bid no bid $313.60
7'x5' no bid no bid $338.10
7'x6' no bid no bid $362 .60
7x7' no bid no bid $386.40
&x3 no bid no bid $314.30
8'xd' no bid no bid $345.10
8'x5' no bid na bid $364.70
B'x6' no bid no bid $399.00
8x7" no bid no bid $410.90
8'x8"' no bid no bid $434.70




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-005
HAULING ROAD MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 2016

North Texas Compression Watts Excavating Kyle Ervin Construction
Bridgeport, TX Decatur, TX Rhome, TX
VENDOR 8/3/16 1:14pm 7/28/116 1:10pm 8/4116 9:45am
diesel fuel price range
$2.50-$2.99 $70.00 $75.00 $83.00
$3.00-33.49 $72.00 $80.00 $86.00
$3.50-53.99 $75.00 $80.00 $89.00
$4.00-54.49 $80.00 $85.00 $92.00
$4.50-%4.99 $80.00 $85.00 $95.00
$5.00-35.49 $80.00 $90.00 $98.00




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-006
MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 4, 2018

Texas Road and Sign Supply

McKinney, TX
VENDOR 8/3/116 9:43am
price per gal 74
price per tanker $3,610.00

notes
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? £ Emulsion Planis, L.L.C.

516 S. MclLennan Loop
Eim Mott, Texas 76640

Phone (254) 829-0330 Fax (254) 829-0337
D?.ernulsions@sbcqIobal.net

Cell:_B\7-302- 64\

Salesman: R Nclornnie

Product Price Sheet for \Wyse County; Effective gy L

Product_ Tanker FOB Plant Tanker FOB County Tote/Drum(Plant}
P2 Prime “Lucky 7-RTU".....51 20/Gallon...... $1.45/Gallon.......... $1.40Gallon
Premixed, ready to use

p2 "Tack 41- RTU" ..ccceeennes $1.65 Gatlon...... $1.90 Gallon........-.. $1.85 Gallon
Premixed, ready to use

P2 “Prime 11 Concentrate”..$1 .99/Gallon...... $2.24/Gallon.......... $2.19/Gallon
Mixes with 6 parts water to make a prime, 4 parts water to make a tack

P2 Stabilizer..........cre ...$2.44iGallon......... $2.69/Gallon.........- $2.64/Gallon
Asphalt Base Stabilizer

P2 Rejuvenator.......x.-zee= $2.47/Gallon......... $2.72/Gallon.......... $2.67/Gallon
Asphalt Rejuvenator

CWE-2...ccmnurmmmsmanmamsmssnanmanes $2.74/Gallon.......-- $2.99/Gallon.......... $2.94/Gallon
All Weather Chip Seal Emulsion

CWP (Cold Weather Patch)..$2.74/Gallon...... $2.99/Gallon........-. $2.94/Gallon
Year Round Pot Hole Patch Emulsion

R.O.Cureerrrrarasanvarassanssness $2.57/Gallon........- $2.82/Gallon........-- $2.77/Gallon

«Road Over Coat” for Chip Seal Roads
»All P2 products are Proprietary/Sole Source products formulated to fulfill
TxDot 300.2 particle charge procedure T59. Positive/CationiC. DO NOT CONTAMINATE WITH DIESEL.

Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 per hour there after.
Pump Charge (trucking charge): $80.00 if needed.

Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons.
Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential.

CONTAINERS AVAILABLE FOR CUSTOMER CONVENIENCE when doing smaller jobs than a tanker amount
=Tote” Contatners (275 gallons size each) cost $1 29.00 per container.

“Orum” Containers (55 gations size each) cost $26.00 per drum.
Containers are re-usable and can be rinsed out, brought back, and be re-filled at customer discretion.
Containers priced separate and sold only with orders for material.

«NOTE: In the event of national crisis or war, affecting extreme changes in pefroleurn pricing, P2 reserves the right to
change quoted of bid prices with 30 days proper written notice.




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-008
ROAD REPAIR

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 4, 2016

SPl Ashpalt
Flower Mound, TX
8/2/16 1:05pm

Price per hour $150.00
Price per 8 hr day $1,200.00
Price per 10 hr day $1,650.00
Min hrs billed daily 4

materials

$3.00 per gallon

minimum

500 gallons

notes

g



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 17-600-009
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 2016

Martin Marietia P&K Stone Hanson Trinity Materials
VENDOR Dallas, TX Chico, TX Irving, TX Arington, TX
4/4/116 8:52am 4/4/16 8:42am 8/3/116 12:58pm 7/25116 10:37am
#1 Flex Base Per Ton Type A Grade 1 flexbase flexbase grade 1
ton/Bidder Loaded $6.50 $7.00 $6.25 o bid
#1 Fiex Base Specialty Per Ton flexbase 1" minus base
ton/Bidder Loaded no bid $7.00 $6.25 no bid
Contractor Grade 2 Base Type A Grade 1/2 flexbase grade 1
ton/Bidder Loaded $6.50 no bid $6.25 no bid
Small Washed Rock Type D Type D
ton/Bidder L oaded $10.50 no bid $10.00 no bid
Large Washed Rock #467 1"-#4 utility grade
ton/Bidder Loaded $12.50 no bid $10.00 no bid
Reject Base Limestone Base
ton/Bidder Loaded $5.50 n¢ bid no bid no bid
Rip Rap 12" Rip Rap Rip Rap
ton/Bidder Loaded $19.00 $15.00 no bid no bid
Rip Rap 18" Rip Rap Rip Rap
ton/Bidder Loaded $20.00 $16.00 no bid no bid
Rip Rap 24" Rip Rap Rip Rap
ton/Bidder Loaded $21.00 $18.00 no bid no bid
Chip Seat Type B Grade 3 TXDOT item 302 County Chip Seal
ton/FOB $18.00 no bid $13.00 no bid
Chip Seal Type B Grade 4 TXDOT tem 302 County Chip Seal
ton/FOB $18.00 ng bid $13.00 no bid
Chip Seal Type C Grade 3
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid noe bid
Chip Seal Type C Grade 4
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Minus Base 3/8" screenings J/8" minus
ton/vendor loaded $7.00 $6.50 no bid no bid
Minus Base 5/8™ 5/8" flex base
ton/vendor loaded $5.00 no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 3/4" #57 natural
ton/FOB $18.00 no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 5/8" 1x5/8 gravel
ton/FOB $18.00 no bid no bid no bid
Pea Grave! 1/2" 1/2"#4 gravel
ton/FOB $28.00 no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel 3/8" 3/8"-#10 gravel 3/8" pea gravel
ton/FOB $18.00 no bid no bid $17.50
Pea Gravel #4
ton/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pea Gravel #8
fon/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
[Pea Gravel torpedo
lon/FOB no bid no bid no bid no bid
Plant Location see below not given Bridgeport Paradise

Martin Marietta plant locations T

n Top, Chico, Bridgeport depending on product
Hanson Chip Seal Rock is modified




PRECINCT 1

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 17-600-009
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

no bid on all

no bid on all

no bid on afl

no bid on all

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 2

Asphait Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

fonfdelivered

Piant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

1on/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered
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AUGUST 4, 2016

FY2017 ANNUAL BID OPENING
WISE COUNTY ASSET CONTROL OFFICE (400 W WALNUT, DECATUR, TX)

ATTENDANCE LIST
(Please Print)
Attendee Name Company
Sohn Hofton Hottop Bfidee 3 O ling.
Mt Kot e Aepht-ke s
RAv TNSLE)/ Ausriy Ast"?uuf L7
‘r < Austin Bridge & Road

M An Austin Industries Company

Austin Bridge & Aoad, L.P
_— 6330 Commerce Drive, Ste. 150

Irving, TX 75063
214-596-7300
214-596-7304 (Direct}

214-596-7397 {Fax}
817-925-0415 (Cell)

SPEI\t '[:“3|9V ptinsley@austin-ind.com
Diéna Alexanmer W Asset Contol Manager

Anaela. Racter WO Asst fud e DL e

Ama«m K INC COML%\' Clod OJ/\U\ @eg)u}z\)




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 17-600-001
ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

VENDOR

Pustin Asphad

s (

C{'

'2‘

-an-(’éx

PRECINCT #1

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalt, type D

2395

mnuﬂ_radl

g2 2o

High Performance Asphait
Concrete

e

L[é‘DHon‘*‘

QG o0

Hot mix asphalt, type B

A5 D

254l

dq -

Hot mix asphalt, type C

ENTYR)

e FrTUrY

Yo " JO

HMCL Type C

Coaad {

i

HMCL Type D

{500
NN

o 02

G50

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

3550

e, O

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

3550

ort2 .~
U

Y3.00

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

395

yg-vo

Cold Mix Asphalt

(6500

Blert-

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Peiformance Asphalt
Concrete

1‘

Hot mix asphait, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

‘Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphait

PRECINCT #3

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrefe

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphall, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #4

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Wam Mix Asphalt Type B

Wamn Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PLANT LOCATION




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 17-600-001

ASPHALT ROAD SURFACING MATERIALS

VENDOR

/Q&q’ ndds AS@MM

PRECINCT #1

FOB PLANT DELIVERED

FOB PLANT

DELIVERED

MATERIALS PER TON

Hot mix asphalt, type D

T3 & TRD ]

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

/' e

Hot mix asphalt, type B

2000 57-98

Hot mix asphalt, type C

“2- 00 oc.9X

HMCL Type C

e

HMCL Type D

e

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

T /

<1 .00 Lo
[

a8
S3 o0 295

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphait

g3 Qg0 o2-9¥%
e I

PRECINCT #2

Hot mix asphalt, type D

\

High Performance Asphalt
Concrefe

Hot mix asphalt, type B

Hot mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

4

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #3 -

Hot mix asphalt, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hot mix asphalt, type B

|Hot mix asphalt, type C

[HMCL Type C

[#mcL Type D

Warm Mix Asphalt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PRECINCT #4

Hot mix asphat, type D

High Performance Asphalt
Concrete

Hol mix asphalt, type 8

Hol mix asphalt, type C

HMCL Type C

HMCL Type D

Warm Mix Asphailt Type B

Warm Mix Asphalt Type C

Warm Mix Asphalt Type D

Cold Mix Asphalt

PLANT LOCATION




VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-002
BRIDGE BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thurdsay, August 4, 20186

PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT PRICE PER LINEAR FOOT W/MATERIALS

Horbon @uﬁ&%

A% -0 ldzer 350w




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 20186

VENDOR MC,._DO@Q%. @m@rﬁ%m PCQAC\J @@is

PRECINCT #1 profit margin cents per galion profit margin cents petgalion

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline {93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin +D.03 + OISy

PRECINCT #2

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin T0.0% + - 0154

PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin +0.03% T.0679

PRECINCT #4

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane} Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin TO-03 t.0(59

Pudolc OV KS
Q> Octane Cosclona £'m 0.3

Dased +0.13
" Monder Yevudrwicr -
50.60 Jmons o Ciou

Per menti *



VENDOR

WISE OOCZ._.<_, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Douglass Dot - ebvolorrndmd oy

PRECINCT #1

profit margin cents per gallon profit margin cents per galion

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline {93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin

+.6( ©. 014

PRECINCT #2

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin

+.0l 0.OIST

PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin

PRECINCT #4

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline {93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin

. 0f U- O1¥2

@b@

U Ochzna
\O e ped

+.60% 0.0250
O-0750




VENDOR

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-003
BULK GASOLINE AND DIESEL

Pahi o

PRECINCT #1

profit margin tents per gallon

profit margin cents per gallon

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline {93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin

- Q.02

PRECINCT #2

Unleaded Gasoline (88 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit _sm_.m__._

—0O-0020

PRECINCT #3

Unleaded Gasofine (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unleaded Gasoline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit Margin

— .02

PRECINCT #4 -

Unleaded Gasoline (89 Octane) Profit Margin

Unieaded Gascline (93 Octane) Profit Margin

No. 2 Diesel Profit _smmw:

— D.0020

TOES
§

Cend

TO.0L73
€ - 0.0020

“TVowdn HUB omc@f&.\




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-004
CULVERTS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 2018

METAL CULVERTS
VENDOR Qb_imﬁz Fockerca W lsem Culvexts
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
12inch, 14 ga. _ 2.66x1/2" G.00 AN 3.25
15 inch, 14 ga. 2.66x1/2" [(. 25 N A/ 10.31
12 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N~ —_—
15 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" N N Y —
18 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" S Am\ (71.00
24 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" A4S -3
30.inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" A0S N 2150
36 inch, 12 ga. 2.66x1/2" o 19 N\ 23 .30
48 inch, 12 ga. 3"x1" <L,50 N 5210
RAILROAD CAR CULVERTS
Price per linear foot Price per linear foot Price per linear foot
5'0" to 5'5" 26" to 28' N N Ny
6'0"to 711" 32' to 35' SN / ~ A7 .
80" 10 85" 32 10 35 . XK. 5
8'6" to 8'11" 38" to 45' N 7 N3
9'0"to 911" 40" to 45' N TSN N
10'0" & greater 40' & longer T o~

q.e,wi ._:.Noo T.ﬁ ucle




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-004

CULVERTS
CONCRETE CULVERTS DQi.mQ) .mwﬁ%a o g:wmj QEQ@L\
\ Price Price , Price
TXDOT #464 RCP \ \
i N b 5 ,
21" \ 24.40
20 \ S do
27" \ Y -OO \
30" \ o U0 \ 4
33" /\\ - 0O .MO ,ﬂ
38 12.30 -
3g" /M( q1.00 \
42 \ O 100, 20 \o)
48" \ ¢l [ AR \ C
54" \ T 0z .00 \ =
60" \ RmW .WO \
\ \
TXDOT #462 Box Culverts \ \
3x2 \ 10520 \
Ix3 \ UO D \
ax2 \ RS \
4x3' \ 435 \
45’ \ 1o(.10 \
52 \ (70.8D \
5x3' 179:20 \
54 197.40 \
5x5' Ao, 50
6x3 224 -SD
Exd' S MO
6'%5' Sr77.90
E'x6' QL. O
7'x3' 2K9-(O
x4 D(R- 0




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

® ﬁlrwb_\\._ﬁ._._oz TO BID ZO\@.\ w.hom\o\o

7'x5'

7'x8'

wﬁ.uN 0,

7'x7"

X0 O

8'x3'

(.30

8'x4’

Y50

8'x5’

e TO

8'x6'

9.0

8'x7

~N Y090

8'xg'

A 434.70




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-005
HAULING ROAD MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 2016

VENDOR Kg le &1udin Comsruchia NIX Compressie (3 dks gérg
diesel fuel price range i ’
$2.50-$2.99 X3 .00 0.0 15 oo
$3.00-$3.49 Slp -0 12090 §0.00
$3.50-$3.99 39 2D SO0 30 .00
$4.00-$4.49 J7.00 3000 LS oo
$4.50-$4.99 Qs.co &0 00 3500
$5.00-$5.49 3%.tD 20.00 Qo0




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-006
MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 4, 2016

VENDOR  4\0S mooef AWE_ A

price per gal .Y [ Adel

price per tanker 3300 fAel.

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-007
ROAD OILS, ASPHALTS, EMULSIONS, AND LIQUIDS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 4, 2016

rouf
VENDOR “From £ Heactand AS E 14 .B%\S?P
Type of Materials delivered |FOB plant} delivered | FOB plant delivergd | FOB plant
CRS-2 [.2]} @k (4o | ]S 1Gt38 | [-35
CRS-2H L2n ™ o S 138 ] LIS
CRS-2P el | [.6S | 14} 38 (o0
CSS-1H (-2 [-20 {.S1 Si138] L3S
AEP 24 230 | ot —
MC-30 Prime OQil ~ N 52 2nv3) 2.0
EC-30 Prime Oil Alternative VLSS @»Q — N S | 9104 IR —
AC-5 Asphalt ' SLY | [.43 (&2, L7628 | (@C
AC-10 Asphalt .58 | 4¢3 [- 727 [y | 1<
AC-10 Asphalt w/tire rubber i i f— o
MC-800 | A28 | (55
HPCPE-50 gal County PU own tote ~ /]
HPCPE-50 gal Vendor provide tote [ N\ /L
HPCPE-50_gal delivered | NI VAR
HPCPE-50 gal tanker delivered N/
Fasblack-M 14dald [ AN
High Performance JARRN
PASS on Base / N
\ 4 N
Demurrage Minimum (% a? W =3
Time Limit 2h 45 mmw PRt by P v b5
Minimum Freight el A, 40O ol “5.&0D L1000 -
Pump Charge > 2000 Pue | FROD Hoof{ad ¥
Plant Location g v (X JD@S\&L\ ;f:i Atponuscet
M 150-
Sl {145

TN

AcC 10-2TR-

All %é

muﬁr :

Seyunow

A 2478 (2

e

210



WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-007
ROAD OILS, ASPHALTS, EMULSIONS, AND LIQUIDS

sured P2 Mo n
VENDOR mO @@ mh/p . ﬂgc.bwpojm ﬂ\u\:\.\@m unk
Type of Materials delivered [FOB plant[ delivered [FOB plant] delivered [FOB plant] delivered [FOB plant
CRS-2 / Gux 2 204 [ S
CRS-2H \ 1/ Cpx-2 R [-52-
CRS-2P \ [ aoieb| 44 | 1S
CSS-1H \ =0C 9] | ) oS
AEP Y - 240
MC-30 Prime Qil 7\ -
EC-30 Prime Oil Alternative /[ N £ §
AC-5 Asphalt f © \
AC-10 Asphalt / \ — \
AC-10 Asphalt witire rubber \ s \
MC-800__ . v S \
HPCPE-50 gal County PU own tote | 4.9 , \
HPCPE-50 gal Vendor provide tote | 5.950 \
HPCPE-50 gal delivered g9 \
HPCPE-50 gal tanker delivered g .\L.Mw A \
Fasblack-M \ J \
High Performance \ Crog Q#J.m@ \
— PASS on Base \ - A¥
A%uuw Qﬁu_s. . \ (25
emurrage mMinimum < o
Time Limit St 80 Hha S
Minimum Freight ~SK_ogl) S A6D o
Pump Charge | SO as 2
Plant Location Cedor SL Nt U\NDS\_ Nr
M S—Le00 Prima 4755 B
frca- bﬁw.rﬁﬁl
nw M C~or ey,

tote .



Amanda Knox

From;

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Diana Alexander <diana.alexander@co.wise.tx.us>
Thursday, August 04, 2016 1:55 PM

Amanda Knox; Rater, Angela

road oil bid -007 P2 emulsions additional pricing sheet
image.pdf

I missed this during the bid opening. See attached.

Diana




-
& -
p Cmyigion Planis, LLC.

516 S. McLennan Loop
Eim Mott, Texas 7

6640
Phone (254) 829-0330 Fax (254) 829-0337

=

2 E.emuisions{o'.sbccalobai.ne’t

- .

Salesman:?\\c)ﬁ Mdownnie Cell: 8\7-302- 6N\

Product Price Sheet for \)yse County; Effective E |4 ik
Product' Tanker FOB Plant Tanker FOB Coun Tote/Drum{Plant
P2 Prime “Lucky 7-RTU"..... $1.20/Gallon...... $1 45/Gallon..........$1 .A0Gallon
Premixed, ready to use
P2 "Tack 41- RTU" ...... veeean$1.65 Gallon......$1.90 Gallon........... $1.85 Gallon
Premixed, ready to use
P2 “Prime 11 Concentrate”..$1.99/Gallon...... $2.24/Galion....... ...$2.19/Gallon
Mixes with 6 parts water {0 make a prime, 4 parts water to make a tack
P2 Stabilizer......... ae$2.44lGallon......o $2.69/Gallon.......... $2.64/Gallon
Asphalt Base Stabilizer
P2 Rejuvenator.........-.cor $2.47/Gallon........ $2.72/Gallon.......... $2.67/Gallon
Asphalt Rejuvenator

CWE-2...............................$2.74IGa|Ion.........$2.99!Ga|lon..........$2.94IGa|lon
All Weather Chip Seal Emulsion

CWP (Cold Weather Patch)..$2.74/Gallon...... $2.99/Gallon.........- $2.94/Gallon
Year Round Pot Hole patch Emuision

RO.C..ccvnnnne ramreesnnensinas $2.57/Gallon........ .$2.82/Gallon.........- $2.77/Gallon

«Road Over Coat” for Chip Seal Roads
*All P2 products are Proprietary/Sole Source products formulated to futfil
TxDot 300.2 particle charge procedure 759. Positive/Cationic. DO NOT CONTAMINATE WITH DIESEL

Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 per hour there after.
pump Charge (trucking charge): $80.00 if needed.

Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons.

Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight Differential.

CONTAINERS AVAILABLE FOR CUSTOMER CONVENIENCE when doing smaller jobs than 2 tanker amount:
“Tote” Containers (275 galions size each) cost $1 20.00 per container.

"Drum” Containers (55 gallons size each) cost $26.00 per drum.
Containers are re-usable and can be rinsed out, brought pack, and be re-filled at customer discretion.

Containers priced geparate and sold anly with orders for material.

«NOTE: In the event of national crisis or war, affecting extreme changes in petroleum pricing, P2 reserves the right 1o
change quoted or bid prices with 30 days proper written notice.




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 17-600-008

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m. Thursday, August 4, 2016

P

ROAD REPAIR

Price per hour | 60 . OO

Price per 8 hr day l}ﬂOO

Price per 10 hr day [,qu O

Min hrs billed daily dpr

materials g 2.00 [GaD
viJ

minimum ’D’OO

notes




WISE COUNTY, TEXAS

INVITATION TO BID 17-600-009
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Bid Opening: 10:00 a.m., Thursday, August 4, 2016

VENDOR

K St

Han s

#1 Flex Base Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded

to-50

.65

s

#1 Flex Base Specialty Per Ton

ton/Bidder Loaded

—-"-"‘

o0

3

Contractor Grade 2 Base

ton/Bidder Loaded

-G 0

l0-25

Small Washed Rock

N\

ton/Bidder Loaded

100

AN

1O -00

Large Washed Rock

N

ton/Bidder Loaded

250

™~

Q.60

Reject Base

ton/Bidder Loaded

250

r——

Rip Rap 12"

ton/Bidder Loaded

[T.00

\o.00

Rip Rap 18"

ton/Bidder Loaded

36 oo

o 00

Rip Rap 24"

ton/Bidder Loaded

1. €0

Chip Seal Type B Grade 3

ton/FOB

1¥. Q0

Chip Seal Type B Grade 4

ton/FOB

1%,00

Chip Seal Type C Grade 3

ton/FOB

a—

Chip Seal Type C Grade 4

ton/FOB

e

Minus Base 3/8"

ton/vendor loaded -~ C MW (5o

Minus Base 5/8"

ton/vendor loaded — 5 ot

Pea Gravel 314"«

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel 5/8"

T
ton/FOB [y

+-
Pea Gravel 1/2" / P

ton/FOB J

Pea Gravel 3/8”

ton/FOB

(71-S90

Pea Gravel #4

ton/FOB

Pea Gravel #8

ton/FOB

<tz
o~

Pea Gravel torpedo

N

ton/FOB

Plant Location

I
VCLFCJDP»/q?




PRECINCT 1

WISE COUNTY, TEXAS
INVITATION TO BID 17-600-009
ROCK AND BASE MATERIALS

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

8

PRECINCT 2

| ]

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

0N

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 3

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

et
-
T

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Plant Location

PRECINCT 4

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 3

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered

Asphalt Pre Coat Rock Grade 4

ton/FOB plant

ton/delivered
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